Freedom of Information Act 2000 – council tenants in rent arrears
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
For each of the following points in time: 
· Now

· End of the reporting year 2018/19

· End of the reporting year 2017/18

· End of the reporting year 2016/17

· End of the reporting year 2015/16

Please could you tell me: 

                                                                                                                                      

1. How many council tenants (including those in council-run emergency/temporary accommodation if applicable) were in arrears on their rent? 

Answer:

2015/16

8,035

2016/17

7,707

2017/18

7,452

2018/19

7,668

2019/20 

(up to 11/02/20) 
7,715
2. What was the total sum owed in arrears?

2015/16

£1,692,220

2016/17

£1,593,475

2017/18

£1,556,588

2018/19

£1,748,658

2019/20 

(up to 11/02/20)
£1,839,431
3. How many of those tenants were Universal Credit claimants? 

2015/16

Information not held*
2016/17

Information not held*
2017/18

240

2018/19

1,879

2019/20 

(up to 11/02/20) 
3,340
4. What was the total THEY owed? 

2015/16

Information not held*
2016/17

Information not held*
2017/18

£69,625

2018/19

£443,967

2019/20 

(up to 11/02/20) 
£721,776
* This letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Please could you also tell me:

5. How does the council plan to cover the current shortfall in rent owed in arrears?

LCC have a specialist income team that manage rent collection for the authority.
The team liaise with key stakeholders and share good practice. The team ensure tenants receive the correct guidance and support to manage their Universal Credit claim. 
Additional, specialist resources were recruited on temporary contracts to assist tenants moving onto Universal Credit. 
The team ensure they follow the rent arrears processes and procedures promptly and maximise the use of Discretionary Housing Payment. 

6. When was Universal Credit rolled out in your authority’s area? 

Universal Credit Live Service rolled out in January 2016 and Universal Credit Full Service rolled out June 2018. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

