Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.

You asked:

Please can you tell me in the period from 2016 to the date of this email, how many cases of graffiti containing the words 'Brexit', 'Remain', 'EU', 'European Union', 'Tory', 'Tories', 'Conservative', 'Boris', 'Johnson', 'Nigel', 'Farage', 'Theresa' 'May', 'Jeremy', 'Corbyn' have been reported to your authority?

For each incident, please tell me

a) The exact wording of the graffiti

b) The location of the graffiti

c) The date the graffiti was reported

d) The cost to your authority of removal - either painting over or pressure washing the surface. If the cost per incident is not available, please give me a rough estimate of the cost to remove an average bit of graffiti to the council

e) For the five most recent cases, please provide me with photos of the graffiti if possible

The database used to record incidents of graffiti, and, the removal of, does not record this level of detail, therefore, the Council does not hold this information.  This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

