Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOI Act) – Population size/adult social care
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. The population size of your Local Authority Area. 

2. The population size of the over 18's in your Local Authority Area. 

3. The population size of the over 65's in your Local Authority Area.

Under section 21 of the FOI Act the Council does not have to respond if the information is accessible elsewhere. The information requested in Q1-Q3 is publicly available information via the Office of National Statistics.  https://www.ons.gov.uk/geography/local-authority/E06000016 
4. The number of customers in your Local Authority area who are in receipt of a community care and support service from your Adult Social Care service including those in receipt of traditional telecare services only. 

5. The number of customers aged between 18 and 64 years who are in receipt of a community care and support service from your Adult Social Care service excluding those in receipt of traditional telecare services only

The local authority is unable to easily identify/exclude telecare service users, as this is not information that is recorded already. There are over 5000 telecare users and each file would need to be looked at manually to see if they match our Adult Social Care users. The Council does not have to respond to the request under section 12 of the FOI Act if it would take over 18 hours to provide you with the information. Alternatively you could refine your request. Please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in doing that.
6. If you are operating a service provision of digital Assistive Technology (i.e. smart digital devices such as Amazon Alexa, Internet of Things Devices etc) what has been the total number of clients referred in to this service in the age range 18 to 64 and the over 65's since it’s the programme’s inception to date. Please provide the operational dates of this service. 

7. If you are operating a service provision of digital Assistive Technology is this service provided internally (i.e. by the Council) or is it outsourced to a specialist private company? 
8. What has been the total number of customers in the age range of 18 to 64 years and 65 years and over who received smart digital devices following an assessment of need. If this information is not available by age range can you state how many individuals in total have received the provision of smart devices since the inception of the service to date. 

This information is not held as it is not currently applicable. Leicester City Council is developing the AT strategy to incorporate smart digital devices, IOT, smart homes, etc.

9. What has been the total number of customers signposted away from Adult Social Care to purchase their own smart digital devices during the operational dates of the service. 

10. Please provide the number of clients who received a reduced care package than they otherwise would have following a social care assessment and the provision of smart digital devices. 

11. The average annual saving per client. 

This is not data that is recorded and therefore the information is not held.

12. The average cost of providing smart digital devices per household. 
13. During the period identified in bullet point 7 please provide the actual amount of reduction in the deficit of the social care budget made during this period through the reduction of: home care visits to existing clients, the delay in admissions to 24 hour care and the avoidance of Short Break Care provision due to the provision of smart digital devices.

14. Could you please supply this information in a format that clearly illustrates a comparison month by month of the number of clients referred in for this service, the numbers accepted for assessment, the numbers receiving smart devices, the cost per client of the equipment, the cost of the traditional social care support they would have received without the provision of the smart devices and the cost of the community care support they received following the provision of the smart devices. i.e. the cost of community care for the client without providing the smart devices and the cost of the community care package for the same client with the provision of smart devices.

15. Could you please supply this information in a format that clearly illustrates a comparison month by month of the number of clients referred in for this service, the numbers accepted for assessment, the numbers receiving smart devices, the cost per client of the equipment, the cost of the traditional social care support they would have received without the provision of the smart devices and the cost of the community care support they received following the provision of the smart devices. i.e. the cost of community care for the client without providing the smart devices and the cost of the community care package for the same client with the provision of smart devices. 
16. The total cost of the smart digital equipment purchased during the period you identified in bullet point 7.
This information is not held as it is not currently applicable. Leicester City Council is developing the AT strategy to incorporate smart digital devices, IOT, smart homes, etc.

17. How many people in your area are in receipt of a Telecare service. 
5219.
18. What is the average cost per deployment of the Telecare equipment across your Local Authority. 

This is difficult to quantify as the Telecare package deployed per person will vary depending upon the needs the Telecare is intended to support. Therefore, the cost of the Telecare package will vary per installation as would the installation costs. Items of Telecare equipment may also be deployed more than once over the lifespan of the equipment and therefore the average cost calculation is not simply the purchase cost of all equipment provided divided by the number of people supported over a period of time. The current average is not anything that is recorded. Therefore this is not information held.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


