FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Can you please provide answers to the following questions relating to Subject Access Requests (SARs)?

1. How many SARs have been made to the council in the last 12 months?
Since 29th July 2019, we have received 251 Subject Access Requests & 117 CCTV requests which we have processed as Subject Access Requests

= 368 requests 

2. Please provide a breakdown of the specific departments that these SARs relate to?
Please find the information attached.

3. Is there a central response to SARs or is it devolved to the departments involved?
There is a central response to SAR’s.  Service areas have to provide the relevant records in order for the centralised team to process the data and respond
4. How many staff deal with responses?

In the Information Governance & Risk team there are 6 people who can deal with Subject Access Requests. 

We are unable to calculate the number of staff throughout the Council who collate the data for us from each individual service area, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

5. On average how many hours are spent dealing with a SAR?
We do not record this data; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

6. Do you have any software to assist with SAR production?
We use InCase Intelligence to log SAR requests and we use Adobe Acrobat 2017 as our redaction software. Both require manual input by members of staff.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk

Leicester City Council

City Hall, 115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ

info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
