Freedom of Information Act 2000 and Environmental Information Regulations Act 2004

Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. What are the Top 10 areas where fly tipping occurs?
The Act relates to recorded information held and does not require the creation of new information specifically to answer a request. We don’t have a ‘top 10’ of fly tipping areas and would have to trawl through records to create such a list. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  Regulation 12(4)(a) of the Environmental Information Regulations is also engaged, we do not hold this information.

2. What is the annual cost to the council for the removal of any fly tipped waste?
£296,508.


3. How many reports does the council receive informing them of waste having been fly tipped?
3,533 incidents

4. How do members of the public report fly-tipping?
Love Leicester App, Online at Myaccount , Social Media Twitter and Facebook, Phone lines, Cllrs, MPs, Direct to officers, by letter and email.

5. How many successful prosecutions for fly-tipping were made in the last 2 years
3.

6. In relation to Q1. Are there any CCTV cameras that monitor these areas? 
This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  Regulation 12(4)(a) of the Environmental Information Regulations is also engaged, we do not hold this information.


7. If there was an intelligent and automated solution that could potentially reduce the amount of fly-tipping that occurred within the areas detailed in question 1, would the council consider investment in such a solution?
The Act relates to recorded information held and does not require the creation of new information specifically to answer a request. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

