Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)
Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR) 
– Cofresh Snack Foods
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

You have previously provided us with information and data relating to the above business, operated by Lakshmi & Sons Limited in response to our request relating to complaints of odour nuisance emanating from that site. 

We understand that the site is under your regulation as local authority. We are interested in the period of operation from 2014 and continuing. Our understanding is that the business known as “Cofresh Snack Foods” is operated by Lakshmi & Son’s Limited which was previously known as Cofresh Snack Foods (March 2002 to August 2010). The appointment of its five directors was terminated on 29 June 2020 and the brand and assets was recently acquired by Vibrant Foods. 

We should be grateful if, as regulator of the site, you are able to provide any information which would assist us such as: 

1. Whether the food production remains under the operation of Lakshmi & Son’s Limited; 
2. Whether the site continues to be operated by Lakshmi & Son’s Limited. 

Answer:

The Council does not hold this information.  This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, this information is not held by the Council.

If the production/operation has changed please advise us of the identity of the current operator and the date on which that change became effective. Indeed, if there is any information which you are able to disclose to us to help us identify whether there has been any change in the operation or ownership of the site please provide it to us. 
Whilst writing we should be grateful if you would provide us with the following: 

a. Records of complaints of odour from local residents emanating from the site from 29 August 2019 to date In this regard, we are aware that you will need to redact the personal information of complainants but we should be grateful if you would kindly leave visible the street names from which the complaints originate; 

Street



Date of call/complaint 

Time of call/complaint

Eileen Avenue 

07/03/20



12:34

27/02/20



15:04

16/10/19



09:58

15/10/19



21:58

28.08.19



14:20

23.08.19



10:12

Brian Road
11.06.20



09:10

01.06.20



09.44

01.06.20



13:27

28.05.20



17:20

21.05.20



08:06

20.05.20



20:14

13.05.20



10:58

05.05.20



08:54

28.04.20



07:46

24.04.20



09:19

16.04.20



09:01

09.03.20



18:12

13.09.19



11:26

Peldon Close
31.07.20



09:17 

09.06.20



10:56

28.05.20



09:38

03.10.19



12:00

Parker Drive
13.08.20



11:41

25.06.20



11:28

24.06.20



11:19

11.06.20



11:19

02.06.20



09:57

01.06.20



13:54

28.05.20



11:38

28.05.20



11:35

05.05.20



11:43

21.11.19



10:09

30.10.19



10:04

30.10.19



11:28

Avebury Avenue
06.05.20



11:48

31.1019



10:44

Ariane Place
28.07.20



15:33

28.07.20



08:34

28.07.20



10:36

21.07.20



11:37

01.07.20



16:38

01.07.20



16:26

09.03.20



08:55

05.02.20



11:01

25.09.19



15:27

19.08.19



11:51

Jean Drive
01.10.19



10:49

27.08.19



10:45

Hazelbank Close
20.11.19



10:05

03.10.19



09:38

20.09.19



11:51
b. Any notices served on the operator in relation to odour nuisance from the site since 1 August 2019 to present day; 

None

c. Any records, attendance notes, memos, reports (or similar) relating to monitoring/site inspections/site visits carried out in relation to odour nuisance from the site since 1 August 2019 to present date. 

27/09/2019, Site meeting at Cofresh offices. 
Present at meeting TO, RM, PP (Managing Director) and RG (Consultant).

*Purpose of meeting was to confirm completion and commissioning of proposed odour abatement plant which was due on 19/09/19.

*Deadline not met for following reasons;

-Drainage access point on the premises not accessible so drainage had to be re-routed across courtyard towards public highway. This resulted in a redesign of the concrete platforms/base on which the plant would rest.

*Further delay was because the ductwork could not be assembled onsite because the components parts are just too big and cannot be accommodated on the factory site. 
The ducting is now being assembled offsite (Nuneaton) and will be transported to site.

*Even more delay has been due to poor weather conditions (high winds and heavy rains) rendering work at height too risky.

*RG forecasted works will be completed by end of October -mid November 2019. PP to provide N&P with weekly updates of progress of works.

*PP to convene meeting once the works have been completed. TO

12/02/2020. TO. Site meeting with PP and GS (Project Manager). 
Discussed new Venturi Scrubber system in details. 
Last Friday 31/01/2020 recirculating fan stopped working resulting is odour complaint. This happened because separation pads were clogged by grease probably insufficient caustic dosing. 
On 12/02/2020 Project Manager installed an automatic dosing pump/meter. GS advised that the installation phase and commissioning is now complete; Project Manager will now carry out a couple of training sessions of Cofresh staff on the performance monitoring before the system is handed over at the end of the month.
GS to email TO details of the manufacturer's maintenance and monitoring schedule. 

16/03/2020, TO & RM held meeting with PP and H to discuss the performance of recently installed odour abatement system. TO pointed out that since the company confirmed that the system was up and running there has been instances of high odour levels e.g. on 7.02.2020 and 04/03/2020. 
PP replied that these events have been investigated and the company now understands why these happened. He added that the recirculating pump tripped on 7/02/2020, and on 05/03/2020 the PH level had drifted. The system has been fitted with an automatic dose meter which adds the caustic into the tank depending on the PH level. PP added the amount of caustic needed is determined manually. **There's still some confusion about what level of manual intervention is required in order for the dose meter to operate efficiently. PP stated that the company are cleaning the filters more regularly than recommended by the manufacturer. RM suggested that it would be reasonable to put in place a weekly cleaning program for the filters. PP added that he is considering a daily cleaning schedule whereby the filters are removed at the end of the day, soaked in caustic overnight and washed in the morning before being re-used.

RM asked what the company's contingency plan is in case this system does not achieve the desired outcome. PP responded that he has made financial provisions for a carbon filtration bed/chamber to be installed.

Old chutes at the rear of the factory are still being used for the crisp production. 

TO asked the company had carried out in-house staff training on the maintenance and performance of the system. PP responded that two officers have been appointed with full responsibility for the system.

Full inspection of the site was not able to be undertaken due to the outbreak of Coronavirus, further date to be confirmed when safe to do so. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
