FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
• Does/ or has your council use any risk-based-verification services provided by an external company to help with processing welfare claims? 
Yes.

Please state how long you have been using it for, and if you have recently cancelled a contract using it then state the date of cancellation. 
1st April 2012, terminated 31st March 2020

Please also say which company provides the service and the cost of its use to date or to the date that it was ceased. Please also say the cost per annum of use.
The RBV product was part of a contract with Civica Open Revenues but the product was provided by TransUnion.  This contract ceased on the 30th June 2020 and the cost each year was between £50 - £80k.

• If you no longer use risk-based verification please state why or direct me to any public board meetings where it is discussed. 
No longer offering value for money against improved timeframe of decision making, taking into account recent measures to improve claim accuracy as part of the Councils review programme together with the Department of Work and Pension Housing Benefit administrative guidelines. The solution is deemed to be no longer cost-effective given the on-going reduction in the Housing Benefit caseload.

Please also say whether you have any figures on its accuracy in decision making (percentage accuracy) or if you consulted with the public on its use.
This information is not held. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
There was no public consultation.
• Does your council use any other algorithms and/or artificial intelligence software/ automated decision making software in the process of delivering public services?
No.

If Yes, please provide details:

(i) Of the algorithms or artificial intelligence software you use;

(ii) Of whether you use a commercial product or whether you have developed your own system. If it's a commercial product, please say the cost of the contract

(iii) Of the purpose for which the algorithm and/or artificial intelligence software operates;

(iv) Of the decisions the algorithm and/or artificial intelligence software is asked to make or assist;

(v) Of the type, classification and amount of data that the algorithm and/or artificial intelligence software uses in the decision-making process;

(vi) Of the process by which the decision made or assisted by the algorithm is subject to human review;

(vii) Of the process by which you inform an individual that they have been subject to a decision made or aided by an algorithm and/or artificial intelligence software?

Please also say whether you have done any checks or reviews for any potential bias in the system before implementing it.

Not applicable.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk

Leicester City Council

City Hall, 115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ

info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
