Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked for:
 

I wish to request information from your authority about the use of discretionary housing payments (DHPs) in the year 2019/20. In particular, I am interested in information on the number of applications for Discretionary housing Payments (DHPs) received by your local authority, the number of applications for DHPs refused and the lengths of time that DHP awards are made for.

For all of the following, we would like to request data for the year 2019/20. Please complete all of the fields possible.

A All applicants
 
DHP applications and awards

The total discretionary housing payment (DHP) budget available to your local authority for the 2019/20 year [please include, and specify, any additional top up funds granted].

Budget £869,657, top-up £51,615.22:

The amount spent or committed on DHPs at the end of the year 2019/20

Total spend £921,272.22

The number of applications for DHP received by your local authority in the year 2019/20

Figure recorded manually – 2,064.


The number of applications refused. 


Applications minus awards = 370. Figure recorded manually without 
categorisation.

Length of time of award

The average length of time a DHP was given for in 2019/20

84 days.

The number of DHPs given for the different time periods listed
 
a. Less than 4 weeks (including one-off payments) 828
b. 4 weeks to 12 weeks 234
c. Between 12 weeks and 26 weeks 408
d. Between 26 weeks and 52 weeks 91
e. More than 52 weeks 133
 
Repeat applicants (if recorded)

The number of applications received where the applicant had previously received a DHP from your authority

Recorded within financial year only – 365.


The number of applications refused where the applicant had previously received a DHP from your authority

This information is either not held by Leicester City Council or it is not feasible to collate the data requested within the 18 hour limit prescribed by the Act.  Therefore, the following exemptions are applicable:


Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council and;


Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.


This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

 

B Applicants affected by low local housing allowance levels

The Local Authority monitoring returns on DHP asks local authorities to categorise DHP spend according to which welfare reforms the DHP was awarded. For the following questions, we are interested in DHP applications and awards made by people affected by Local Housing Allowance (LHA) reforms

DHP applications and awards

The number of applications received where the reason the applicant was in need of support was that they were impacted by low LHA levels

Not recorded – only awards, not applications are categorised. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

The number of these applications refused

Not recorded – refusals are not recorded by our system. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

The average length of time a DHP award was given for in 2019/20, for households affected by low LHA levels

124 days.


The number of awards made for households affected by low LHA levels for the following reasons
· To help with on-going rental costs for disabled person in adapted accommodation
6
· To help with on-going rental costs for a foster carer

0.
· To help with on-going rental costs for any other reason
253

The average length of time these DHPs were given for
· To help with on-going rental costs for disabled person in adapted accommodation
96 days.

· To help with on-going rental costs for a foster carer

N/A.
· To help with on-going rental costs for any other reason
125 day

The number of these DHPs given for the different time periods listed
a. Less than 4 weeks (including one-off payments)
55.
b. 4 weeks to 12 weeks




43
c. Between 12 weeks and 26 weeks


113
d. Between 26 weeks and 52 weeks


36
e. More than 52 weeks




12
C Applicants affected by the household benefit cap

 

DHP applications and awards

The number of applications received where the reason the applicant was in need of support was that they were impacted by the household benefit cap

Not recorded – only awards, not applications are categorised. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

The number of these applications refused

Not recorded – refusals are not recorded by our system. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

The average length of time a DHP award was given for in 2019/20, for households affected by the benefit cap

107 days

The number of awards made for households affected by the benefit cap for the following reasons

· To help with on-going rental costs for disabled person in adapted accommodation

0
· To help with on-going rental costs for a foster carer

0
· To help with on-going rental costs for any other reason
182.
The average length of time these DHPs were given for
· To help with on-going rental costs for disabled person in adapted accommodation

N/A

· To help with on-going rental costs for a foster carer

N/A
· To help with on-going rental costs for any other reason
107 day.

The number of these DHPs given for the different time periods listed
a. Less than 4 weeks (including one-off payments)
30
b. 4 weeks to 12 weeks



49
c. Between 12 weeks and 26 weeks

79
d. Between 26 weeks and 52 weeks

9
e. More than 52 weeks



15
D Discretionary Housing Payment’s allocation policy

Your most recent Discretionary Housing Payments policy document, setting out the procedures in place for determining DHP awards

Please find the relevant information attached.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

