Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)
Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR) – dog fouling
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. The cost of dog fouling in your area of responsibility.  
Answer:
This information is not recorded separately, it is part of our wider job role. The Council therefore does not hold this information and is advising you as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held.

2. The number of callouts from the public and other bodies to have dog faeces removed from streets and other public areas i.e. through "Fix my Street" and other platforms you may use.

233 fouling removal requests have been received during the last 3 years. 

3. The cost to the Council for dog fouling over a 3 year period from 2017 to present.

As 1 above
4. The number of bins you have in our area of responsibility for dog waste.

2,865 multipurpose bins are situated across Leicester, these accept general and dog fouling waste. 
5. Disposal costs per year for dog waste.

The Council does not have separated costing for dog waste disposal.  This is therefore a refusal notice as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held.

6 The number of collections on a monthly basis over the course of 12 months preferably from 2018-2019 due to the COVID 19 lockdown. 

The total number of dog fouling incidents removed is not recorded by the Council. 
All litter bins are emptied at least once per week. 

7. The costs to the Council for providing dog waste services.

As 1 above

8. Are you currently working on any innovative solutions to treat dog waste in your areas?

The Council do not treat dog waste.
Our City Wardens and Parks Officers are tasked with reducing Dog Fouling and have approached this in various ways over the past few years, including promotional events at local hotspots engaging with dog owners, giving out bags to clear up along with information, we have also introduced a number of dog control Public Space Protection Orders. https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-environment/pollution-and-pests/dog-control/
County wide campaigns have also been run in the past, advertising and promoting the issue across different media platforms. 
Currently we are using temporary spray stencils to mark out popular dog walking routes where we have reported dog fouling issues to make dog walkers aware that it’s an offence.

9. The cost to procure bins for dog waste in your area

Multipurpose bins are sited throughout Leicester to accept general and dog waste.  

A separate budget isn’t available solely for dog bins therefore this is a refusal notice as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held. 

10. The number of man hours taken to clean up dog waste fouling over 12 months

As 1 above

11. How many fines have been issued to dog owners for fouling in your area?

2017 to 2018 - 25 Fixed Penalty Notices (FPNS) issued
2018 to 2019 - 9 FPNS issued
2019 to 2020 - 3 FPNS issued
12. Is there a budget for dog fouling waste clean-up? if so, how much of the public budget is allocated to it?
There is no separate budget to remove dog fouling. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
