FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 (FOIA)/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 (EIR)
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Do you have a 5G strategy?

Answer:

No, Leicester City Council does not have a 5G strategy. This is therefore information not held and a refusal notice under FOIA Section 1(1) and EIR Reg.12(4)(a).
Network providers will determine the rollout of 5G in Leicester, in accordance with the Government’s 5G strategy. See https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/future-telecoms-infrastructure-review. 

1.1 If yes, I request to see the complete strategy, its ambitions and its objectives in PPTX, Word, PDF or picture format.

N/A

1.2 If yes, has the public had the opportunity to read and understand Leicester City Council's 5G strategy? Where was this information published?

N/A

1.3 I also request a supplementary document that includes the highest level of detail on all 5G technology that’s planned to be used and currently in use in public spaces within Leicester and Leicestershire:

(a) Companies and entities involved and the names of the company/entity officers.

(b) Specification sheets of 5G technology.

(c) What technology e.g. units and arrays are not currently 5G, but can be 5G enabled e.g. with current software, future software, hardware upgrades or retrofitting?

(d) What UK, EU and International safety standards is Leicester City Council complying with for the 5G strategy and existing 5G technology.

(e) I request proof e.g. a certificate from Leicester City Council that confirms that UK, EU and International safety standards for workers and the public have been met.

N/A

1.4 If no, I request to know when you will be chairing a 5G strategy?

Leicester City Council has no plans to chair a 5G strategy. We will however be publishing our Smart City strategy at the end of this year.

2. I request the name/s of the Officer/s in charge of the 5G strategy and roll out for 5G and Smart Cities; and who their subject area expert or consultancy is, their CV and qualifications on 5G and Smart Cities.
Kieran O’Hea is Leicester City Council’s Head of Smart Cities. 
Kieran is leading the development of Leicester’s Smart City strategy, which will be city-needs led and demand-driven. He was formerly Chief Digital Officer of Brisbane, which was only the second city in the world to appoint a Chief Digital Officer, after New York. There he led the development of the city’s Digital Strategy, which continues to support thousands of residents, SMEs and start-ups. Any further data is withheld under Section 40(2) of the FOI Act / Regulation 13 of the EIRs – Personal Data.
3. Are you in talks with any experts, companies or entities about autonomous vehicles (AV) for public transport and/or private use on Public Highways?

No, we are not in talks with anyone about autonomous vehicles. This is therefore information not held and a refusal notice under Section 1(1) of FOIA and EIR Reg.12(4)(a).
3.1 If yes, I request to see the complete strategy, its ambitions and its objectives in PPTX, Word, PDF or picture format.

N/A

3.2 I also request a supplementary document that includes all levels of detail on:

(a) Companies and entities involved and the names of the company/entity officers?

(b) Specification sheets of all technology.

(c) What type of communication system will Leicester City Council be utilising to control the vehicles?

(d) What UK, EU and International safety standards does your AV strategy and rollout comply with?

(e) I request proof e.g. a certificate from Leicester City Council that confirms that UK, EU and International safety standards for workers and the public have been met.

N/A

4. Do you have a strategy for smart roads and smart signage on Public Highways and Public spaces?

No, we do not have a strategy for smart roads and signage on public highways and public spaces. This is therefore information not held and a refusal notice under Section 1(1) of FOIA and EIR Reg.12(4)(a). 

Here is a link to the city’s local transport plan which you may find useful:
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/178149/local-transport-plan-part-a.pdf
4.1 If yes, I request to see the complete strategy, its ambitions and its objectives in PPTX, Word, PDF or picture format.

N/A

4.2 I also request a supplementary document that includes all levels of detail on:

(a) Companies and entities involved and the names of the company/entity officers? 
(b) Specification sheets of all technology. 
(c) What technology e.g. units and arrays will not be 5G, but can be 5G enabled e.g. with current software, future software, hardware upgrades or retrofitting etc (you must be specific on anything here)? 
(d) What UK, EU and International safety standards does your 5G strategy and rollout comply with? 
(e) I request proof e.g. a certificate from Leicester City Council that confirms that UK, EU and International safety standards for workers and the public have been met. 
N/A
5. Are you planning to rollout or have rolled out LED street lighting?

The LED street lighting conversion project was rolled out in 2013.

5.1 If yes, please answer these questions:

(a) What is the CMS and specification of the software and hardware of the LED street light system?

Telensa Central Management System and OrangTek LED lighting system.

(b) What type of waveform is the LED? e.g. Square wave?

The lighting system uses LED drivers with constant current, the DC output is flat with no wave.

(c) Can you control the Pulse Width Modulation (PWM) of the streetlight system using the CMS?

N/A
(d) Can you control the PWM of each streetlight that’s connected to the system?

N/A

(e) What restrictions do you have in place for the control of the PWM?

N/A

(f) What is the UK, EU and International safety limit (low and high) for the amount of ‘flicker’ (Hz) the Human Body and eyes can be exposed to and for how long?

Leicester City Council does not hold this information. This is therefore information not held and a refusal notice under Section 1(1) of FOIA and Regulation 12 (4)(a) of the EIR.
(g) I request to see the training manual and safety operation manual for the CMS and the LED streetlight system.

Leicester City Council do not hold this information, it is held by Telensa in relation to the CMS.

(h) Who is the company who is or has installed the CMS LED streetlight system?

Balfour Beatty Living Places.

(i) What company maintains and repairs the CMS and LED streetlight system?

Balfour Beatty Living Places.

(j) What entity and Officer is responsible for the safety standards for the CMS and LED streetlight system?

Telensa and the Maintenance & Installation Teams

(k) I request proof e.g. a certificate from Leicester City Council that confirms that UK, EU and International safety standards for workers and the public have been meet.

All LED lighting units & CMS systems are CE marked and therefore conform to applicable British Standards and EU Regulations at the time of manufacture.

(l) What is the amount of Blue Light leakage that’s safe for the public and workers during the LED streetlights operation?

(m) What level of LED streetlight exposure is safe for the public at daytime and night time?

With respect to Qs l and m above, Leicester City Council do not hold this information, therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the FOIA and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held.
(n) Is there a legal requirement for diffusers to be fitted to LED streetlights?

No

(o) How have you have addressed the amount of Oxidative Stress on Human and Animal cells that’s produced from LED?

All LED products are CE marked and therefore conform to applicable British Standards and EU Regulations at the time of manufacture.

5.2 If no, then I request a declaration from Leicester City Council that you will not be installing LED streetlights in the future. If you cannot provide a declaration, I would like the following answered in the future tense: 
We cannot answer a request in the future tense. The FOI Act / EIRs do not oblige public authorities to create new information or give an opinion if this is not information that is already held. This is therefore information not held and a refusal notice under EIR Reg.12(4)(a) and FOIA Section 1(1).

 (a) What is the CMS and specification of the software and hardware of the LED street light system?

(b) What type of waveform is the LED? e.g. Square wave?

(c) Can you control the Pulse Width Modulation (PWM) of the streetlight system using the CMS?

(d) Can you control the PWM of each streetlight that’s connected to the system?

(e) What restrictions do you have in place for the control of the PWM?

(f) What is the UK, EU and International safety limit (low and high) for the amount of ‘flicker’ (Hz) the Human Body and eyes can be exposed to and for how long?

(g) I request to see the training manual and safety operation manual for the CMS and the LED streetlight system.

(h) Who is the company who is or has installed the CMS LED streetlight system?

(i) What company maintains and repairs the CMS and LED streetlight system?

(j) What entity and Officer is responsible for the safety standards for the CMS and LED streetlight system?

(k) I request proof e.g. a certificate from Leicester City Council that confirms that UK, EU and International safety standards for workers and the public have been meet.

(l) What is the amount of Blue Light leakage that’s safe for the public and workers during the LED streetlights operation?

(m) What level of LED streetlight exposure is safe for the public at daytime and night time?

(n) Is there a legal requirement for diffusers to be fitted to LED streetlights?

(o) How have you have addressed the amount of Oxidative Stress on Human and Animal cells that’s produced from LED?

N/A
6. Where do you have 3G and 4G systems in public spaces and public roads?

The Council does not have 3G and 4G systems. This information is not on our systems. Your request concerns technology which could have been installed in the last 15 years. To research and provide information about where such systems may be found will take more than 18 hours. Details of 3G and 4G coverage are available here: https://www.nperf.com/en/map/GB/2644668.Leicester/-/signal/. This is therefore a refusal notice under Section 12 of the FOI Act / Reg.12(4)(b) of the EIRs.
Copies of all commercial Leicester City Council public liability insurance policy certificates with what is covered, policy numbers, providers and underwriters held by Leicester City Council. In particular, make sure anything regarding ‘pollution liability’, ‘policy enhancement’ and ‘schedules of exclusions’ documents in relation to the commercial public liability insurance

policy held by Leicester City Council.

Please find attached, a copy of Leicester City Council’s public liability policy certificate which includes policy number, provider and underwriters. 

Policy schedules are commercially sensitive.  Under section 43(2), information is exempt if its disclosure to the wider world (which is how any disclosure made under the FOIA must be considered) would, or would be likely to, prejudice commercial interests of any person (including the public authority holding it). 

Third party interests may be jeopardised by the release of information that relates to the sensitive commercial information held about a business. Business rivals would benefit from knowing the methodology and respective business model of a company. This would provide rival companies with information that could potentially damage the commercial interests of a provider and disadvantage the Authority in negotiating future contracts.

In addition, there is an expectation by suppliers/contractors that the Council will not reveal their business model. Companies spend a great deal of time and money putting together bids, costings, policies and supply them with an expectation of confidentiality. The information has the necessary quality of confidence to put the Council at risk of an actionable breach of confidence. Were the Council to make such a disclosure it could jeopardise not only the trust and confidence between Council and provider for this project, but also for future contract negotiations. The information is therefore exempt from disclosure by virtue of section 41(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, Information Provided in Confidence.

Copies of the ‘certificate of indemnity’ from Leicester City Council that may include the public insurance provider and underwriters, confirming that any injuries, damages or adverse health effects directly or indirectly arising out of, resulting from or contributed to by electromagnetic fields, electromagnetic radiation, electromagnetism, radio waves or noise, wireless RF radiation,

microwave radiation, non-ionising radiation emitting devices and equipment.
Again, as above, policy schedules are commercially sensitive and are exempt under the provisions of Section 43.2 - Commercial Interests. This is a statutory refusal notice required by Section 17.1 of the FOI Act.  

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
