Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked for:
 

1) Has your local authority launched its own contact tracing operation?
Yes, Leicester City Council has a system for contacting cases that have not been contacted by NHS Test and Trace
If so:

2) When did it launch?
This started 14th July 2020

3) Has it operated continuously since launching?
Yes.

4) If not, what periods has it ceased operating?
Not applicable.

5) How many people are working on it?
There is a team of people who work on this but it is part of other roles that they have. There are 12 people that can work on the phones and 6 people who can be called to visit homes. 

6) How many of those are paid?
They are all paid as its part of their local authority role.
7) And how many are volunteers?
None.

8) Have they been recruited from other local authority teams? If so, which?
No, not applicable.

9) How many people with coronavirus are they contacting to gather their contacts? Please provide the numbers for Monday 12th, Tuesday 13th and Wednesday 14th October
Monday 12th: 
11

Tuesday 13th: 
37

Wednesday 14th :
12

10) How many of those contacted’s close contacts are successfully being contacted and told to isolate and get a test? Please provide the numbers for Monday 12th, Tuesday 13th and Wednesday 14th October
We do not contact the close contacts, this is done by the national team. Therefore we do not hold success rate data for contacts successfully reached.

11) What is the total spend to date on your local authority’s contact tracing service and team?
12) What is the total budget for your local authority’s contact tracing service and team?

This information is not yet available – it has not been fully captured at this point. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
If not

13) Are there plans for a contact tracing service to be set up? 
14) If so, when is the aim to launch it by?
15) If applicable, how much budget has been allocated for it?
16) If applicable, how many staff are earmarked to work on it and from which teams?

Not applicable.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

