FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
· Social Care Support
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Within your local authority area, For the following time periods
1. 01-01-2020 to 01-10-2020

2. 01-01-2019 to 31-12-2019

3. 01-01-2018 to 31-12-2018

4. 01-01-2017 to 31-12-2017

5. 01-01-2016 to 31-12-2016

6. 01-01-2015 to 31-12-2015

the number of: 
1. Home visits carried out to people receiving social care support by social care workers and/or personal assistants;
2. Days out and holidays provided under social care support;
3. Meals delivered to those in receipt of social care support;
In respect of Qs.1-3, the Council do not record this information.  The Council therefore does not hold any information and is informing you as required by 
Section 1(1) of the Act.
4. Social care assessments carried out under the Care Act.
	Period
	Care Act Assessments Completed in Period

	1. 01-01-2020 to 01-10-2020
	1305

	2. 01-01-2019 to 31-12-2019
	2332

	3. 01-01-2018 to 31-12-2018
	2841

	4. 01-01-2017 to 31-12-2017
	3640

	5. 01-01-2016 to 31-12-2016
	3840

	6. 01-01-2015 to 31-12-2015
	4381


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
