FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 (FOIA)/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 (EIR) - Highways
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Highway Bond Provision

1. Please could you confirm which of these individual elements your Authority includes within your bond requirement for all highways work for S278 and S38 agreements? Please use the tick boxes provided.

Answer:
Bond values are calculated on the total value of highway works 

2. Please could you provide the total bond value for S278 and S38 agreements for the past 3 financial years, and the total number of bonds completed in each year?
2017/18

Section 38 
£161,758.07 
Section 278 
£628,500.00
Completed 
S38, 1
S278, 2

2018/19

Section 38 
£1,404,111.30
Section 278 
£82,442.00
Completed 
S38, 2 
S278, 1

2019/20

Section 38 
Nil
Section 278 
£1,669,229.23
Completed 
S38, nil
S278, 3
2020/21

Section 38 
£532,271.88
Section 278
Nil
Completed
S38, 2
S278, nil

3. Please confirm what items of adoptable highway infrastructure currently attract commuted sums, and what are the individual costs?

Agreements between the Local Highway Authority regarding development works may contain provisions for commuted sums for future maintenance.  There are currently no limitations on the scope of commuted sums. The following table shows routinely used commuted sum rates which will be revised periodically to reflect index linked costs.  The table is not exhaustive and items not listed may attract commuted sums.  The omission of an item or rate does not imply exclusion from application of commuted sums.
	COMMUTED SUMS
	 
	 
	
	

	Surface - Additional areas
	Units
	Rate
	
	

	Carriageway (standard bituminous materials)
	Sq m
	8.24
	
	

	Carriageway (stone mastic asphalt)
	Sq m
	24.76
	
	

	Carriageway (hot rolled asphalt)
	Sq m
	17.26
	
	

	Carriageway (200 x 100 x 80 mm concrete block paving)
	Sq m
	12.07
	
	

	Carriageway (Tegula blockwork or similar)
	Sq m
	16.7
	
	

	Footway (standard bituminous materials)
	Sq m
	8.24
	
	

	Footway ( 200 x 100 x 60mm concrete block paving)
	Sq m
	11.99
	
	

	Footway (Tegula blockwork or similar) 
	Sq m
	18.62
	
	

	Verges & other grassed areas
	Sq m
	5.82
	
	

	High-friction surfacing (anti-skid)
	Sq m
	99.8
	
	

	Parking bays
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Feature
	Units
	Quantity
	
	

	Highway structures
	 
	 
	
	

	Fencing/Bunds
	Units
	Quantity
	
	

	Typical Safety fencing (TCB or OBB)
	lin. m
	17.38
	
	

	Knee rail fencing
	lin. m
	 
	
	

	Earthwork environmental bunds
	 
	 
	
	

	Drainage
	Units
	Quantity
	
	

	Sustainable urban drainage systems
	 
	 
	
	

	Hydrobrake
	item
	3,439.64
	
	

	Non-standard drainage system elements
	 
	 
	
	

	Culvert debris screen
	Item
	 
	
	

	Petrol and oil interceptors
	Item
	 
	
	

	Combined kerb and drainage systems
	lin. m
	24.5
	
	

	Bollards
	Units
	Quantity
	
	

	Typical  Plastic Linpac / Glasdon Bollard 
	Item
	964.35
	
	

	Concrete Bollard
	Item
	553.15
	
	

	Wooden Bollard
	Item
	840.63
	
	

	Timber Effect recycled bollard
	item
	 
	
	

	Cast Iron Bollard
	Item
	913.41
	
	

	Trees and planting:
	Unit
	Quantity
	
	

	Small Tree
	Item
	404.62
	
	

	Medium Tree
	Item
	587.49
	
	

	Large Tree
	Item
	 
	
	

	Tree grills
	Item
	374.45
	
	

	Planters and raised beds
	Item
	 
	
	

	Shrub planting/Ground-cover planting
	Sq m
	66.79
	
	

	Speed restraint features:
	Unit
	Quantity
	
	

	Non-bituminous ramp to flat-topped speed hump/table
	Item
	597.4
	
	

	Overrun areas to roundabout (granite setts)
	Sq m
	63.88
	
	

	Overrun areas to speed control bends (granite setts)
	Sq m
	42.26
	
	

	Mini roundabouts
	Item
	 
	
	

	Bus shelters
	Item
	 
	
	

	Bus gates
	Item
	 
	
	

	Street Lighting:
	Unit
	Quantity
	
	

	Standard 5m columns
	Item
	1,796.75
	
	

	Standard Raise and Lower 5m column
	Item
	2,053.02
	
	

	Standard 6m columns
	Item
	2430.31
	
	

	Standard Raise and Lower 6m column
	Item
	2,296.47
	
	

	Standard 8m columns
	Item
	 
	
	

	Standard 10m columns
	Item
	 
	
	

	Heritage 6m (Newcastle) columns 
	Item
	1,991.80
	
	

	Heritage 8m (Edinburgh) columns
	Item
	2,369.08
	
	

	Illuminated traffic signs:
	Unit
	Quantity
	
	

	Not exceeding 1m2 sign face
	Item
	 
	
	

	Illuminated more than 1m2 and not exceeding 3m2 sign face
	Item
	 
	
	

	Illuminated more than 3m2 sign face
	Item
	 
	
	

	Non-illuminated traffic signs: 
	Unit
	Quantity
	
	

	Not exceeding 1m2 sign face
	Item
	 
	
	

	More than 1m2 and not exceeding 3m2 sign face
	Item
	 
	
	

	More than 3m2 sign face
	Item
	 
	
	

	Illuminated bollards
	Item
	 
	
	

	Traffic signals
	 
	 
	
	

	EXTRA OVER COSTS FOR USING ALTERNATIVE MATERIALS
	 
	 
	
	

	Alternative carriageway or shared-surface surfacing materials:
	Unit
	Quantity
	
	

	Surface dressing using locally-sourced granite aggregate chippings 
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Standard 200mm x 100mm x 80mm concrete block paving surface course
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Surface dressing using crushed rock aggregate from specific non-local source
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Surface dressing using pea gravel aggregate from local source
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Surface dressing using pea gravel aggregate from non-local source
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Surface dressing using crushed gravel aggregate from local source
	Sq m
	27.78
	
	

	Surface dressing using crushed gravel aggregate from non-local source
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Stone mastic asphalt
	Sq m
	16.52
	
	

	Hot or cold applied coloured surfacing (resin system)
	Sq m
	91.57
	
	

	Standard surface course materials using coloured binder and coloured aggregate or chippings 
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	‘Imprint’ or other similar approved hot‑applied, polymer-modified, synthetic bitumen-based compound, surface applied block paving alternative finish 
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	‘Tegula’ or similar approved concrete block paving surface course
	Sq m
	8.44
	
	

	Conservation'/'Charnwood' type kerbs
	lin. m
	1.85
	
	

	Alternative footway and hard paving surfacing materials:
	Unit
	Quantity
	
	

	Surface dressing using locally-sourced granite aggregate chippings 
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Surface dressing using crushed rock aggregate from specific non-local source
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Surface dressing using pea gravel aggregate from local source
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Surface dressing using pea gravel aggregate from non-local source
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Surface dressing using crushed gravel aggregate from local source
	Sq m
	36.08
	
	

	Surface dressing using crushed gravel aggregate from non-local source
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Hot or cold applied coloured surfacing (resin system)
	Sq m
	38.94
	
	

	Standard surface course materials using coloured binder and or coloured aggregate or chippings 
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	‘Imprint’ or other similar approved hot‑applied, polymer modified, synthetic bitumen-based compound, surface applied block paving alternative finish
	Sq m
	 
	
	

	Conservation Slabs (Marshalls) 450 x 450 x 70
	Sq m
	1.06
	
	

	Footway ( 200 x 100 x 60mm concrete block paving)
	Sq m
	3.49
	
	

	‘Tegula’ or similar approved concrete block paving surface course
	Sq m
	10.66
	
	

	
	
	
	
	


4. Please could you confirm your inspection fee or percentage applicable relevant to the bond provision for S278 and S38 agreements?
This information is published on the Council’s website at the following link:

www.leicester.gov.uk/transport-and-streets/roads-and-pavements/
This letter therefore constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the FOIA and exception Regulation 6(1)(b) of the EIR is being applied, namely the information is already publicly available and easily accessible to the applicant in another form or format. 

Highway S38/S278 Timescales

Section S278 Agreements relating to residential developments during each of the past 3 financial years.

1. Please could you confirm the average time taken from a technical submission to technical approval?
2. Please could you confirm what is the average time from technical approval to the completion of a Section 278 legal engrossment?
3. Please could you confirm the average time to grant a Streetworks Permit, post execution of Legal Engrossment?
Section 38 Road Adoptions relating to residential developments during each of the past 3 financial years.

1. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken from technical submission to a response to the submission?
2. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken from the response to Technical Approval?
3. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken from Technical Approval to the completion of a Section 38 legal agreement?
4. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken from the completion of a Section 38 legal agreement to the commencement of the maintenance period?
5. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken from the commencement of the maintenance period to the date of formal adoption?
6. Please could you confirm the average time from the issue of the Final Certificate to the cancellation of the bond?

In response to all questions in this section, the Council do not hold records of average times. This is therefore a refusal as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held by Leicester City Council.
7. If you reduce the value of the bond as a development progresses at what stages do you reduce the value, and by what percentage?
Bonds are reduced by 70% with issue of a Maintenance Certificate.
Survey Questions

1. What in your opinion is an appropriate timescale for the submission and final execution of a S38/ 278 Agreement, and why?

2. Do you have target timescales for submission to final execution? If yes, what are they?
3 What improvements do you think could be made to the overall process from submission to engrossment?
4. What improvements are you already considering/ have already implemented? For example, Hampshire have created a developer portal which allows the developer and HA to monitor the progress of any S278/S38 agreements at all stages.

5. Would you consider using the developer obtained tender value for calculating the bond provision for S278 and S38 agreements? What conditions would you need in place to do/consider doing this?

6. Are you currently planning to/ do you use Novation Agreements for step in rights for developers and contractors where original contractors do not complete works?

7. Would you accept applications for and grant Street Works Permits prior to Legal Engrossment on the proviso that planning permission has been granted?

8. What in your opinion is an appropriate timescale for Technical Submission to Formal Adoption for both S278 and S38 agreements?

9. Would you consider completion of a legal agreement before confirmation of Land Title Registration?

The above survey questions are not applicable under FOIA as they do not relate to information held. FOIA gives you the right to access recorded information held by public sector organisations. To provide a statement is to create new information and therefore does not fall under the remit of the Act. This therefore is a refusal as required by Section 1(1) of the FOIA and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held by the Council. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
