FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 

- homelessness 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Town planning department – 

1) What or how many structures and features that are designed to be “hostile infrastructure” or “anti-homeless” are there within the city that were commissioned by local authority? What are the dates either of when these were agreed upon in meetings, or when these were commissioned, or when they were constructed?

Answer:

No structures of this type have been constructed.  As such the Council does not hold this data and is informing you as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held.

2) What has been done to reduce homelessness since this time period up until March 2020?

N/A – ‘since this time period’ is not applicable as no structures of this type have been constructed.
3) What were the projected aims and goals set to improve homelessness within the county since the commissioning of these structures?

N/A – ‘since commissioning of these structures’ is not applicable as no structures of this type have been constructed.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
