FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 
· Bullying and racism in schools
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. Does the council have a record of the number of incidents of bullying recorded by local schools in the following years?
2015-16
2016-17 
2017-18 
2018-19 
2019-20 
2020-21
1.A 
If it does, please state what types of bullying are recorded, e.g. racist, homophobic, religious, disability related, etc?
1.B 
Does the council have any more general records of racism in schools in any/all of the above years, e.g. records of racist incidents rather than racist bullying?
2. What was the total number of racist incidents (or incidents of racist bullying) reported by schools to the council in each of the following school years? (Please specify whether the data held refers to racist incidents or racist bullying.)
2015-16
2016-17 
2017-18 
2018-19 
2019-20 
2020-21
2.A 
What was the total number of schools that reported racist incidents or racist bullying to the council in each of the following school years? (Please specify whether the data held refers to racist incidents or racist bullying.)
2015-16
2016-17 
2017-18 
2018-19 
2019-20 
2020-21
3. Does the council have a record of incidents of hate crime recorded by local schools and/or the police? (For example, this might be reports made by schools to the police.)
3.A 
If so, does this include figures specifically on racial hate crimes?
4. If the council has a record of racial hate crimes in local schools, please provide the total number of incidents recorded in the following school years.
2015-16
2016-17 
2017-18 
2018-19 
2019-20 
2020-21
4.A
Are the figures for racial hate crimes included in the figures for racist incidents or racist bullying (question 2)?
Answer:

In respect of Qs.1 to 4 above, the Council does not hold the requested information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

5. Does the council have records of school exclusions for racist bullying (or racist incidents) in any of the below school years?
2015-16
2016-17 
2017-18 
2018-19 
2019-20 
2020-21
Yes, for all the above years

6. If the council has records of exclusions for racist bullying (or racist incidents), how many were recorded in below school years?
2015-16
24
2016-17 
23
2017-18 
12
2018-19 
14
2019-20 
6
2020-21
4
6.A
For each year please state how many were i) fixed-term exclusions and ii) permanent exclusions.
	Year
	Fixed
	Permanent


	2015/16
	23
	1

	2016/17
	22
	1

	2017/18
	12
	

	2018/19
	14
	

	2019/20
	6
	

	2020/21
	4
	


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
