FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 – liability claims
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

Q1. Thinking about the entirety of 2020, how many times did you receive a complaint or liability claim against your council? Please think about all claims from both businesses and the public. If figures are not available for 2020, please provide those for the nearest 12-month period 
188.
 
Q2. Thinking about the past five years, how many times did you receive a complaint or liability claim against your council? Please think about all claims from both businesses and the public. 
1646 claims in the last five years.

 
Q3. What was the financial value paid out by your council to settle these claims during the entirety of 2020 and over the past five years? Please supply two figures. If figures are not available for 2020, please provide those for the nearest 12-month period
2020:

£22,586.75

Last 5 years:
£2,296,585.33

*damages and costs inclusive

Q4. Please provide the top five most common claims being filed against your council during 2020, or the relevant equivalent 12-month time period
Pothole

Operative Error
Tree Roots

Water Leak

Slip/Trip

Q5. How much council time was spent dealing with liability claims and related legal proceedings in 2020? Again, if figures are not available for 2020, please provide those for the nearest 12-month period
This information is not recorded on our system and is therefore information not held.  This letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
 
Q6. In an average 12-month period, what percentage of claims do you settle and to what value? E.g. X% at a value of £XXM. 
Over the past 5 years the Council has accepted fault on 20% claims received. The average annual value is £459,317 including damages and costs.

Q7. In an average 12-month period, how much did the council spend on legal fees defending these claims? 
This information is not easily available from the system and would require a detailed breakdown of each claim which would take more than 18 hours to collate. The information is therefore exempt from release under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act. We have however answered the questions above which is what we are able to do without exceeding the time limit and hope this is helpful.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
