FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. What methods do you use to collect data on the number of rough sleepers.

We usually conduct a bi-monthly  physical street count, and collate data weekly on an ongoing basis. This year for our annual count  we carried out a spotlight count and estimate, both   of  which were verified by Homeless Link. 

 

2. Please supply any estimate, survey data or other information on the number of rough sleepers, including most recent figures as of 30 November 2020, and figures for previous years if available. 
(Homeless link verified)

November 2017 – 31

November 2018 - 31

November 2019 - 22

November 2020 - 12

 

3. How many people were engaged in the government programme ‘Everyone In’ in 2020?
424 from 1st March to 31st July 2020
111 - 1st August to 31st October 2020

Total: 535
Additional investment of over £1million is helping to ensure that no-one has to sleep rough in Leicester this winter, despite unprecedented challenges and demand for our homelessness services. 

 

The extra investment is part of Leicester City Council’s ‘Everyone In’ strategy & programme, which is designed to ensure that no-one needs to sleep rough in the city. To support this, additional funding has been secured to ensure that outreach services can be extended to operate seven days a week over the winter, to offer accommodation and support to anyone found sleeping rough.  

 

Part of this funding is associated to a successful bid to the Protect pathway for a further £300,000. The protect pathway is for those extremely complex Rough Sleeping cases. Leicester have identified 25 named individuals that this work will be targetted towards. The bid includes some significant extra health input, we have been working with Turning Point, Leicestershire Homelessness Mental Health Team & Inclusion healthcare. The bid includes Dedicated Physical ,Mental Health & Substance Recovery Support Packages, Peer Mentors for the Homeless and a further accommodation offer with provision  of Wet Accommodation with 12 ensuite rooms with significant staff input and support.

 

We are also currently waiting to hear in relation to bids totalling over £3m for longer term projects through the Next Steps programme funding, which would deliver another 64 units of long term accommodation with appropriate wrap around support attached to these. 

  
4. How many people who were engaged in the Everyone In programme in March are now (a) in permanent accommodation, (b) in temporary accommodation, (c) evicted from accommodation and no further contact, as of 30 November 2020. 

The information is not held in a format that would allow us to isolate the March cohort.  As an alternative we can provide details for the 535 as at 31st October 2020:

(a) 173

(b) 344

(c) 18
5. The number of rough sleepers as of 27 November 2020,  who have spent a night or more on the streets, for the first time, since April 2020. 

165.

 

6. The number of rough sleepers, who have spent a night or more on the streets, between 30 October 2020 and 30 November 2020. 

19.

 

7. Number of shelter beds available in your local authority as of (a) 30 November 2018 (b) 30 November 2019 and (c) 30 November 2020

a) <20

b) 45

c) None, as a result of COVID-19-related closures, hoped to be temporary.

With dormitory style emergency accommodation no longer safe to operate due to the need for social distancing, the city council has been successful in finding more than 180 self-contained flats and rooms in shared houses over the last nine months. These provide safe, short-term accommodation for people who would otherwise have nowhere to stay. The city council’s Dawn Centre continues to provide 45 self-contained rooms for emergency accommodation, assessments and access to expert medical help and support.

 

Work with local charities Action Homeless, Help the Homeless and One Roof has also helped secure funding for an additional 26 self-contained flats and rooms at locations across the city, this is on top of the 269 units of single TA accommodation we have as our core and extended offer. These will all be made available over the winter months to provide emergency accommodation to anyone at risk of rough sleeping.  All of the accommodation is backed-up with one-to-one help and support from the city council and its partners to help people move on to long-term, settled accommodation. 

8. Number of people in temporary accommodation as of (a) 30 November 2018 (b) 30 November 2019 and (c) 30 November 2020

The information is not available for November and is therefore information not held, Information held for last day of Q2 (Sept 30th) of each year:

a) 2018 – 259 

b) 2019 - 266

c) 2020 - 352

 

9. Number of people in temporary accommodation as of (a) 30 November 2020 broken down into a table to include age and ethnicity. 

This data is not held in a format that would allow us present this retrospectively for 30th November and is therefore information not held.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
