Freedom of Information Act 2000 – discretionary housing payments
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked for:

(i) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April-December 2020
Answer:
2,032

(ii) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April-December 2020 made to
(i)  
private renters
714
(ii)  social renters
1,318
(iii) If available, the total number of discretionary housing payments per month made by your council over the period April-December 2020
	Apr-20
	May-20
	Jun-20
	Jul-20
	Aug-20
	Sep-20
	Oct-20
	Nov-20
	Dec-20
	Not recorded

	196
	226
	210
	248
	221
	204
	178
	243
	156
	150


(iv) The total amount in cash terms in issued discretionary housing payments over the period April-December 2020
£774,037.58

(v) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April 2019 - March 2020
1,329
(vi) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April 2019 - March 2020 made to 
(i) 
private renters 

479
(ii) 
social renters 

850
(vii) If available, the total number of discretionary housing payments per month made by your council over the period April 2019 - March 2020
	Apr-19
	May-19
	Jun-19
	Jul-19
	Aug-19
	Sep-19
	Oct-19
	Nov-19
	Dec-19
	Jan-20
	Feb-20
	Mar-20
	Not recorded

	202
	88
	80
	93
	91
	85
	108
	70
	52
	111
	98
	132
	119


(viii) The total amount in cash terms issued discretionary housing payments over the period April 2019 - March 2020

£921,972.22
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
