Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) - Grants
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

I would like to uncover more information relating to the following grant programmes:
· Disabled Facilities Grant

· SEN (Special Education Needs and disabilities)

· Test & Trace Support Payment

· Community Led Local Development (CCLD)

· Affordable Homes

· Local Growth Fund

· Independent Living Fund

· Preventing Homeless

· Troubled Families

· Revenue Support Grants

For each grant programme, could you please confirm the following - 

(a) the total amount awarded (in £)

(b) total number of applications

(c) total number of applications granted

You clarified:
1) For each of the grants I would like the data for the last 3 years (if possible) or at the very least for the last 12 months. I'm aware some grants are newer than others. Worth noting, if providing data for the last 3 years would put this over the time/financial thresholds permitted by the FOIA, please just provide the data for the last 12 months.

2) How much has been paid to other parties.

Answer:

Please find information in the attached file
In relation to the Community Led Local Development (CCLD) grant, the Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
