Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)/Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR) - potholes
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1) How many potholes were reported in 2018?
Answer: 1480
2) How many potholes were reported in 2019?
834

3) How many potholes were reported in 2020?
989

4) How many potholes were repaired in 2018?
5,228
5) How many potholes were repaired in 2019?
3,623
6) How many potholes were repaired in 2020?
3,585

Responses for Qs7-18 are based on the incident date.

Data includes motor and injury claims.

7) How many pothole compensation claims were received in 2018?
100
8) How many pothole compensation claims were received in 2019?
28
9) How many pothole compensation claims were received in 2020?
38

10) How many pothole compensation claims were paid out in 2018?
52
11) How many pothole compensation claims were paid out in 2019?
3
12) How many pothole compensation claims were paid out in 2020?
5

13) How many pothole compensation claims were rejected in 2018?
48
14) How many pothole compensation claims were rejected in 2019?
25
15) How many pothole compensation claims were rejected in 2020?
33

16) How much did the council pay out for pothole inflicted compensation claims in 2018?
£12,178.40
17) How much did the council pay out for pothole inflicted compensation claims in 2019?
£1,389.95
18) How much did the council pay out for pothole inflicted compensation claims in 2020?
£550.00

19) What was the budget for repairing potholes in 2018?
£1.61 million
20) What was the budget for repairing potholes in 2019?
£1.5million
21) What was the budget for repairing potholes in 2020?
£1.5million

22) How much did the council spend on repairing potholes in 2018? £1,681,626
23) How much did the council spend on repairing potholes in 2019? £1,774,873
24) How much did the council spend on repairing potholes in 2020? £1,130,421 as at 05-03-21 
The Authority’s Financial Year is from April 1st to 31st March 

25) How many hours were spent on repairing potholes in 2018?
26) How many hours were spent on repairing potholes in 2019?
27) How many hours were spent on repairing potholes in 2020?
In respect of Qs.25-27, the Council does not record the hours spent on repairing potholes. 
Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the FOIA and Regulation 14 of the EIR, because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of FOIA and Regulation 12(4)(a) of EIR, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
