FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

I am writing to request Information under the Freedom of Information Act. 

I would like to know the answers to these two questions:

· What percentage of successful applicants to all jobs at your council were white males over 50-years-old in 2016, 2017, 2018, 2019 and 2020?

· What percentage of all applicants to all jobs at your council were white males over 50-years-old in 2016, 2017, 2018, 2019 and 2020?

I'm looking for a simple table in the format below.

	
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020

	% of successful applicants who were white males over 50 
	
	
	
	
	

	% of all applicants who were white males over 50
	
	
	
	
	


NB: If you do not hold the raw data to generate all of these values, please provide the ones you are able to calculate in any case.
	
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020

	% of successful applicants who were white males over 50* 
	6.9%
	5.8%
	5.9%
	5.7%
	7.7%

	% of all applicants who were white males over 50**
	Not held
	Not held
	Not held
	7.8%
	6.5%


 

*this is the number of successful new starters in these years, so shows external recruitment only, and where ethnicity is declared.

**This the % of those that made a declaration for; sex, age and ethnicity.

Information prior to 2019 is not held. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Please see below practises that support non-biased recruitment: 

Application Form – We ask applicants to complete our diversity questionnaire as part of their application form to ensure that all applicants have fair and equitable access to our job opportunities and appointments are made on merit. We can only judge our success in achieving these objectives by collecting and analysing this equality data from all job applicants. However, applicants are informed before applying that their data will be treated in the strictest confidence and will not be seen by the recruiting manager at any point before, during or after the selection process and will be used only for the purposes of anonymous equality monitoring of our recruitment process and workforce. The age range question is not mandatory and they can select ‘prefer not to say’.

Anonymous Shortlisting – all applicants who apply for a role with Leicester City Council are completely anonymous (i.e. no personal details are viewable) until after the shortlisting is complete. This removes bias from the selection process.

Unconscious Bias Training – This course is mandatory for all recruiting managers and panel members prior to advertising.

Qualifications – Job Specifications now only include the need for statutory qualifications. This allows for experience to be considered as opposed to a desired qualification.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
