Freedom of Information Act 2000 - domiciliary care service 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked for:

1a. The number of total deaths notified to the council amongst home care (domiciliary care) service users, by the day or month of notification (whichever is easier), between 01 April 2017 and 28 February 2021. 

Answer:
	Month
	No. of Deaths

	Apr-17
	21

	May-17
	22

	Jun-17
	26

	Jul-17
	12

	Aug-17
	20

	Sep-17
	18

	Oct-17
	28

	Nov-17
	39

	Dec-17
	30

	Jan-18
	34

	Feb-18
	45

	Mar-18
	36

	Apr-18
	26

	May-18
	24

	Jun-18
	26

	Jul-18
	30

	Aug-18
	27

	Sep-18
	27

	Oct-18
	25

	Nov-18
	32

	Dec-18
	26

	Jan-19
	26

	Feb-19
	34

	Mar-19
	26

	Apr-19
	39

	May-19
	26

	Jun-19
	17

	Jul-19
	26

	Aug-19
	24

	Sep-19
	29

	Oct-19
	24

	Nov-19
	29

	Dec-19
	27

	Jan-20
	43

	Feb-20
	41

	Mar-20
	29

	Apr-20
	51

	May-20
	35

	Jun-20
	33

	Jul-20
	34

	Aug-20
	32

	Sep-20
	37

	Oct-20
	28

	Nov-20
	42

	Dec-20
	58

	Jan-21
	65

	Feb-21
	44

	TOTAL
	1,473


(including domiciliary care via a Direct Payment)


1b. For the total number of deaths referenced in Question 1a, could you provide an age breakdown under the following categories: Under 18, 18-64, 65+. 

	Category
	Number of Deaths

	Under 18
	N/A (under 18s receive Short Break packages of care that are not classed as Domiciliary Care) 

	18-64
	183

	65+
	1,290


(including domiciliary care via a Direct Payment)


2a. The number of deaths notified to the council, involving Covid-19 amongst home care (domiciliary care) service users, by the day or month of notification (whichever is easier) since records began in 2020 until 28 February 2021.

	Month
	Number of Deaths

	Mar-20
	0

	Apr-20
	8

	May-20
	6

	Jun-20
	1

	Jul-20
	1

	Aug-20
	0

	Sep-20
	0

	Oct-20
	0

	Nov-20
	5

	Dec-20
	0

	Jan-21
	5

	Feb-21
	8


(Covid-19 related deaths, does not include domiciliary care via a Direct Payment)

2b. For the total number of deaths referenced in Question 2a, could you state how many people died as a result of confirmed Covid-19, suspected Covid-19, and did not die of Covid-19.

Confirmed Covid-19 deaths - 34
Suspected Covid-19 deaths – This information was not recorded* 

Did not die of Covid-19 - This information was not recorded*
*This information is not held. This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.


If possible, please also include the following:

3. The total number of people using local authority purchased domiciliary care services, for the tax years - 2017/18, 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21 to date.

2017/18 – 2,562

2018/19 – 2,506

2019/20 – 2,594

2020/21 (to 10/03/21) – 2,616

(the above figures do not include domiciliary care via a Direct Payment)


4. The total number of local authority-purchased hours for domiciliary care services, for the tax years - 2017/18, 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21 to date.

2017/18 – 918,672 hours

2018/19 – 1,088,139 hours

2019/20 – 1,151,965 hours

2020/21 (to 10/03/21) – 1,202,526 hours

(the above figures do not include domiciliary care via a Direct Payment)


5. A list of your current home care (domiciliary care) providers.
The following care providers are contracted with Leicester City Council 
(*indicates SPOT contract provider)

Adaptus Carers Limited

Alliance SC Ltd*

Alpha Imperial Care*

Amicare Domiciliary Care Services Ltd

Aspire UK

Blue Arch Homecare*

Bluewood Recruitment Ltd

Bonney Care Agency

Care 4U (Leicestershire) limited

Carers Direct Homecare Ltd

Choices Care Ltd

CM Community Care Services Ltd

Creative Care Ltd*

Direct Health (UK) Limited

Domiciliary Care Services (UK) Limited

Evolving Care Limited

Family Care Agency Ltd

Fosse Healthcare Ltd

Hales Group Limited

Help at Home

HH Care Limited – Meadows

HK Care Consulting Ltd*

Homecare4U Limited

I-Call Care*

Medacs Health Care PLC

Melton Care Services Limited

Meridian Health & Social Care (Sevacare) 

Mi Life Care Services Limited

Panashe*

Precious Hope Health & Home Care Ltd

Private Home Care UK LTD

Raageh Care Ltd*

Select Care Services*

Sensitive Care Solutions Ltd*

Spirit Homecare

Synergy Homecare*

TLR Healthcare Services Ltd*

UK Care Team Ltd

UK Top Care Limited*

Wellbeing & Support Ltd*

Westminster Homecare Limited

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
