FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding your council’s expenditure on temporary accommodation for homeless individuals and families. Please can you provide the following information:
1. The total amount spent by the council on temporary accommodation in each of the last five financial years (2019/20 to 2023/24).
	
	£
	

	2019/20
	467,403
	

	2020/21
	357,270
	

	2021/22
	798,966
	

	2022/23
	1,526,372
	

	2023/24
	7,126,717
	

	Total
	11,076,728
	

	
	
	


Split by year for all temporary accomodation, NET, less Housing Benefit received.
2. A breakdown of this spending, specifically:

· The amount spent on B&Bs and hotels as temporary accommodation in each of the last five financial years
Bed & Breakfast /Hotels costs for the years requested were :

2019-20 £61.8k

2020-21 £29.5k

2021-22 £1,389k

2022-23 £2,304k

2023-24 £8,408k

These are gross figures and exclude HB etc. to offset the costs

In addition to Hotels/Bed & Breakfast being used as temporary accommodation – privately owned properties have also been used to house Homelessness people for which gross costs were as follows :

2019-20 £659k

2020-21 £485k

2021-22 £2,160k

2022-23 £2,450k

2023-24 £2,442k

· The number of households placed in B&Bs/hotels each year.
2019/20 = 62
2020/21 = 452
2021/22 = 300
2022/23 = 375
2023/24 = 803
3. The longest continuous period any household has spent in B&B/hotel accommodation in the last 12 months.
196 days.

4. The average length of stay in B&B/hotel accommodation for homeless households in the last 12 months.
48 days.

I would also like to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding the condition of council housing in your local authority. Please can you provide the following information:
5. The total number of council-owned homes managed by the local authority currently classified as not fit for human habitation under the Housing Act 2004 or deemed non-decent under the Decent Homes Standard.
88 out of 19,500 Coucnil homes, equating to only 0.5% of all homes the Council owns
6. A breakdown of the reasons why these homes have been classified as unfit (e.g., damp/mould, structural issues, electrical hazards, lack of heating, etc.).
All 88 of these were considered to be not in a reasonable state of repair under the Decent Homes Standard. Note that in all cases current tenants have been offered the required improvements to achieve decent homes standard but have refused.
7. The number of complaints from tenants about poor housing conditions received by the council in each of the last five financial years (2019/20 to 2023/24).
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information requested in a reportable format; this data isn’t collated, we do not record the nature of a complaint.  The Corporate Complaints team would need to trawl through all complaints received to establish the numbers relating to mould/damp/wiring etc. and collate the data.  This would require hundreds of hours of officer time.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

8. The amount spent on repairs and maintenance of council homes in each of the last five financial years.
	Repairs and Maintenance

	Financial Year
	£'000 

	23-24
	£                            27,649 

	22-23
	£                            35,007 

	21-22
	£                            32,137 

	20-21
	£                            27,985 

	19-20
	£                            29,419 


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
