FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I want to make a Freedom of Information request, could you please send me the following information with regards to the organisation’s Mobile Phones contract.

 

You may have received the same request in the past and this information sent has now expired and I require an update as soon as possible for the following information:
 

If there is more than one provider, please split all the information including the annual average spend, number of connections, duration, contract dates and internal contact details.

 

Network Provider(s) - Please provide me with the network provider name e.g., EE, Telefonica, Vodafone, Three 

Telefonica .

 

2. Annual Average Spend for each Network Provider - Can you please provide me with the average annual spend over the last 3 years. If this is a new contract, can you please provide the estimated annual spend. 

£298,750.

 

3. Number of Connections- Number of connections for each network provider. (Number of voices only devices, voice and data devices, data only devices) please provide me with the breakdown and not the overall total.

Voice Only          601

Voice & Data      2638

Data Only           792

4. Duration of the contract- please state if the contract also includes contract extensions for each provider. 

7 years and 4 months.
 

5. Contract Start Date- please can you provide me with the start date of the signed agreement. Please do not provide me with the framework contract date. I require the contract dates of the signed agreement. (if there are multiple start dates, could you please provide me with the earliest date for each provider) 

24/06/2015.

 

6. Contract Expiry Date- please can you provide me with the expiry date of the signed agreement. Please do not provide me with the framework contract date. I require the contract dates of the signed agreement. If the contract is rolling, please state. 

24/10/2022.

 

7. Contract Review Date- Please can you provide me with a date when the organisation plans to review this contract. 

In review now. 

 

8. The person in the organisation responsible for this particular contract. Can you send me the full contact details Contact Name, Job Title, Contact Number and direct email address for each network provider? If full contact details cannot be provided, please send me their actual job title. 

This is undertaken by the Digital Data and Technology Procurement Team. The information requested is exempt under section 40(2) – personal data - and section 31 - law enforcement. The Council does not release direct contact details of its non-senior staff as it can identify junior individuals and also put the Council at a higher risk of phishing attacks, fraud and social engineering. It is not in the public interest to put the Council at a higher risk of such cybercrime.
 

9.If the mobile phone contract is provided by a managed contract, please provide me with the actual name of the network provider along with the number of connections and the internal contact from within the organisation responsible for this contract. 

N/A. Therefore this is information not held under the FOI Act.
 

Please can you provide me with the latest information- If the organisations are currently out to tender, please can you also state the approx. date of the award along with the information above.

Also, if the contract in the response has expired/rolling please can you provide me with further information if available of the organisation's plans going forward with regards to mobiles and the contract status? 

We will use Network Services 2 - CCS (crowncommercial.gov.uk).  Initially we were going to use their Aggregate offering, however this is not expected until Jan 2023 which is therefore out of scope based on our expiry date, and therefore we will undertake either by direct award (subject to catalogue review) or as a further competition.  

 

If this contract was awarded within the past three months, can you please provide me with a shortlist of suppliers that bid on the contract? 

N/A. Therefore this is information not held under the FOI Act.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
