Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: dog barking complaints
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. The total number of complaints received about dog barking between January 2022 and May 2024.

Answer:

This letter constitutes a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in the public domain. 

This information is available on the Council’s Transparency and Open Data webpage - Noise and Pollution Complaints — Leicester Open Data
2. If recorded, how many of these complaints referred to barking occurring in early morning hours (between 4:00am and 8:00am)?

This information is not available, therefore exemption section 1.1 of the Act apply -information not held by the Council.
3. Any available data or summary that categorises complaints by:

· Time of day
This information is not available.
· Reason for complaint (e.g., persistent noise, sleep disturbance, early wake-ups)

This information is not held by the Council.  Code used is dog barking.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
