FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
	How many pupils were admitted to Castle Mead Academy in each of the last 5 years?


	Year 7

October Census Information

Oct-22
247
Oct-21
239
Oct-20
237
Oct-19
234
Year 7

January Census Information

Jan-23
figures not yet published
Jan-22
716
Jan-21
481
Jan-20
237


	How many appeals were heard and how many were successful in the relevant year group in the last 5 years?
	Appeals for Y7

Appeals Heard

Appeal Allowed

2018

School not yet open

2019

0

0

2020

1

0

2021

3

1

2022

22

1



	How many pupils are on roll now in Years 7 to 11?
	On roll as of

NCY 7

NCY 8

NCY 9

NCY 10

NCY 11

10 March 2023

249

242

242

241

0



	When was the last review of the school’s capacity?
	Information is not held by the Council and this response informs you of this as required by Section 1(1) of the Act. 

You are advised to contact the school directly to obtain this information.  You can do so via:
info@castle-tmet.uk


	Have there been any changes to the school since that review?
	Information is not held by the Council and this response informs you of this as required by Section 1(1) of the Act. 

You are advised to contact the school directly to obtain this information.  You can do so via:
info@castle-tmet.uk


	What was the number of pupils at Castle Mead Academy as per the census in January for the last 5 years?
	Census date

NCY 7

NCY 8

NCY 9

NCY 10

NCY 11

Jan-22

238 

238 

240 

0 

0 

Jan-21

241 

240 

0 

0 

0 

Jan-20

237

0

0

0

0

Jan-19

School not yet opened

Jan-18

School not yet opened



	How many students left the school over the last 5 years in the year group being appealed for (year 7)?
	Academic Year

Number of Students

2022/23
7
2021/22
24
2020/21
18
2019/20
46


	Please provide me with the average percentage of children with a special educational need within the school and a comparison of that with the national average.
	National Average - Jan 22

Castle Mead Academy - Jan 22

EHCP

2.20%
1.10%
SEN Support

11.90%
15.10%


	Please provide me with the average percentage of children in receipt of the pupil premium for the school and a comparison of that with the national average.
	Ever 6 National Average - 2022

Pupil Premium -Castle Mead Academy – Oct 22

26.90%
36.15%


	Please provide me with the percentage for those children who have English as an additional language and again a similar comparison with the national average.
	English as an additional Language - National Average at Jan 22

English as an additional Language - Castle Mead at Jan 22

17.60%
31.70%


	For the last academic year, what was the distance from the school to home address of the last child to be admitted?
	For 2022/23 entry – 1.575 miles

	Please provide information on how these distances (see 11) are calculated.
	Distances are measured on a straight-line basis using a geographical information system measuring from the geo-code reference point from the child’s home address to the Geo-code reference point for the school.




You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
