FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.
Leicester City Council holds some of the information you have requested.
You asked:
I am writing to make a request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 

Please could you provide me with the following information relating to family assessment centres within your local authority area: 
1. The current level of demand for family assessment centres (e.g., number of referrals or assessments requested over the past 12 months). 
Answer: Over the past 12 months, 14 family assessment placements have been made. We do not record the number of requests received, however this number would be higher than the number of placements made. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. Whether there is currently a waiting list for family assessment centres, and if so, the number of families or individuals currently on the waiting list and the average waiting time. 
We have 1 open/live referral for a family assessment centre, this is for a mum and 2 children. We do not record the average waiting times/ length of placement search, as this can be determined by court timescales. 

3. The total number of placements made in family assessment centres during the calendar year 2024. 
7

4. The number of placements that were needed but could not be fulfilled in 2024, along with the reasons if recorded (e.g., lack of capacity, provider availability). 
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

5. A list of all providers of family assessment centres that your authority commissions, contracts with, or refers families to. 
· Dudley Lodge

· Inspirations Leicestershire

· The Woodbridge Family Centre

· Parents in Partnership (PIPS)

· 24/7

· Progressive Care

6. Whether any in-home residential parenting assessments (also known as outreach or community-based assessments) have been commissioned or arranged during 2024, and if so, who the providers are. 

N/A
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
