FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Notice periods for unpaid accounts

Request:

Copies of any policies, procedures, standard operating guidelines, manuals, or internal documentation that specify the number of days’ notice issued to account holders before any unpaid account is escalated to legal or court action, including (but not limited to) missed payment notices, final demand notices, and escalation timelines

This information is held and published by the Council and is therefore exempt from disclosure under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (information accessible by other means).

Details of the notice stages, reminder notices, final notices, and escalation timelines are set out in the Leicester City Council Debt policy specifically Appendix 1, which provides a flowchart of the statutory recovery process.

2. Policies or standards for communication during investigations

Request (a):

Copies of any policies, procedures, standard operating guidelines, manuals, or internal documentation that describe expected timelines, service standards, or targets for responding to correspondence when a formal investigation by the council is ongoing (including definitions of “ongoing investigation” and any relevant performance targets)

The Council does not hold a standalone policy defining “ongoing investigations” for Council Tax purposes. However, where an enquiry or complaint is logged against an account, the Council’s system allows recovery action to be paused to prevent escalation while the matter is considered.

For Council Tax enquiries, the Council aims to respond within 21 days.

For the purposes of this response, an “ongoing investigation” refers to any enquiry or complaint received by the service that is being actively considered.

Request (b):

Specifically, I am requesting clarification on whether policies exist regarding the use of alternative communication methods (such as SMS/text messages) for account holders when prior communication has been via email or post, including guidance on timing relative to the closure of any account freeze or ongoing investigation and before escalation to court proceedings
The Council does not hold a specific standalone policy governing the use of SMS messages for Council Tax recovery. However, SMS messages may be used operationally to alert customers that a summons will be issued if no contact is made to discuss payment or if the account is not brought up to date.

The purpose of these messages is to encourage engagement and avoid additional costs being incurred. Such messages are not considered marketing communications.

The timing of recovery stages, including escalation to court action, is set out in the Leicester City Council Debt Policy, which applies regardless of the communication channel used.

3. Statistical data (last 24 months)

Request (a):

The number of days’ notice given on average before escalation to court for unpaid accounts

The Council does not hold this information. Recovery action follows the statutory process, which is detailed in the flowchart contained within the Leicester City Council Debt policy. The Council does not calculate or record an average number of days before escalation to court.

In accordance with Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this information is not held.

Request (b):

The number and percentage of email or postal correspondence related to ongoing investigations that were responded to within the policy timeframe versus those that were not

For the last 24 months, over half (53%) of all email and postal correspondence relating to ongoing investigations was responded to within the Council’s 21-day service target.

Correspondence not responded to within this timeframe typically related to more complex cases, cases requiring third-party information, or situations where recovery action was paused while enquiries were investigated.

4. Council Tax liability (additional query)

Request:

What makes a person liable for council tax. Is it a rental contract in his name or is it having the keys of the house in his possession?  Say a contract was to end later but he gives the keys back, how does this affect liability for council tax?  

The Freedom of Information Act provides a right of access to recorded information and does not require the Council to provide legal advice or interpretations.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
