FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I kindly request the following information in the context of domestic waste bin/sack collection services, as opposed to trade/commercial collections or waste disposal.

1. Do you currently operate waste services (collections) directly, or through a waste contractor such as Biffa, Suez or Veolia. If through a contractor, please name them.
Response:
Waste collections are currently operated under contract by Biffa Leicester Limited.

2. Which of the IT systems below do you use for the management of day to day municipal bin collections:
a. Yotta / Causeway
b. Bartec Collective
c. AMCS Clear
d. Whitespace/Powersuite
e. Contender
f. Selected Interventions / Echo
g. Core (Suez)
h. Webaspx / Routeware
i. Routesmart
j. MS Office
k. No IT system
l. Other: [please name]
Response:

Not applicable as outsourced

3. Which IT system do you use for each of the following in your refuse collection vehicle fleet and associated staff:
3a. Fleet management system. Response:
3b. HR system. Response:
3c. RCV on-board camera system. Response:
3d. Telematics / vehicle tracking provider. Response:

This information is not held by Leicester City Council, this would by held by Biffa Leicester Limited. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.

4. What IT system(s) do you use to manage the following service areas:
4a. Grounds/Parks maintenance. Response:
Grounds Maintenance Colony & Down to Earth

Tree management – Ezytreev

Parks assets – PSS Live


4b. Street cleansing. Response: 
MS Dynamics (graffiti) 
Love Clean Streets 

Day to day operations managed in house.

5. How many Electric Vehicles do you have in your waste collections fleet?
Response:

Nil.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
