Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: non-decent housing  
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

Each year local authorities in England submit data to the MHCLG (now DLUHC) concerning local authority housing stock. This includes data on the condition of the dwelling stock, dwellings that do not meet the decent homes standard, and associated costs of making them decent. 
This FOI request is seeking more specific data in relation to this MHCLG collection and therefore definitions should be read within the context of the guidance given to councils when completing this return.
A home is non decent if it meets one or more of the following criteria: 
a) does not meet the current statutory minimum standard for housing due to having one or more serious ‘category 1 hazards’ under the Housing Health and Safety Rating System (HHSRS), 
b) is not in a reasonable state of repair, 
c) does not have reasonably modern facilities and services, and/or 
d) does not provide a reasonable degree of thermal comfort. 
One example category 1 hazard is excess cold, where sub-optimal indoor temperatures are deemed a threat to occupant’s health.
The request
For the following questions, please provide data that was correct as of 31 March 2021. If this is not possible however, please provide the most recent available data and specify the date of extraction (i.e., what date the data is correct as of). I would like to know:
1. How many council-owned dwellings failed the decent home criteria by virtue of suffering from a category 1 hazard of ‘excess cold’? Please only include Class 1 hazard dwellings, and not those that fail because they do not have a reasonable degree of thermal comfort.

Answer:

Zero

2. Of the council-owned dwellings with a class 1 excess cold hazard, how many are occupied?

Not applicable

3. Of the council-owned homes with a class 1 excess cold hazard which are occupied, how many have not had work to address the cold hazard because the tenant refused to allow the work to be carried out?

Not applicable

For the next question, I would like your most up to date snapshot. Please tell me:
4. How many council-owned dwellings fail the decent homes standard by virtue of a) category 1 excess cold and b) not having a reasonable degree of thermal comfort. Please provide figures for a) and b) separately and specify how many any dwellings fall into both categories. Please tell me what date the data provided was extracted. 

1st April 2021 - Zero.

Finally, please provide answers to the next questions for the last five full financial years (2016/17, 2017/18, 2018/19, 2019/20, 2020/21), broken down by year:
5. In the last five financial years, how much has the council spent to remove class 1 excess cold hazards from council owned dwellings? 

Any properties with class 1 excess cold hazards are as a result of tenant refusals.  
For the purpose of decent homes reporting these are not recorded as non-decent.  
These are dealt with when properties become vacant.  The Council do not separate out empty property expenditure by element, therefore this information is not available and as such this is refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

6. In the last five financial years, how much has the council spent to make council-owned dwellings ‘without a reasonable degree of thermal comfort’ decent? Please only include the money spent on improving the thermal comfort - for instance if a home was non-decent because it both had an unreasonable degree of thermal comfort and was not in a reasonable state of repair, please count only the money spent improving the thermal comfort. 

As above, this information is not available.

Again, any properties that are not considered to have a reasonable degree of thermal comfort, are as a result of tenant refusals. For the purpose of decent homes reporting these are not recorded as non-decent. These are dealt with when properties become vacant. We do not separate out empty property expenditure by element, 

7. In the last five financial years, how much has the council spent to prevent dwellings becoming non decent due to non-reasonable thermal comfort or due to having an excess cold category 1 hazard?

	Year
	Expenditure to prevent non-decency:

Thermal comfort/Excess cold hazard



	2016/17
	£3,607,000

	2017/18
	£3,715,000

	2018/19
	£3,617,460

	2019/20
	£3,394,000

	2020/21
	£2,100,000


8. In the last five financial years how much has the council paid out in grants to a) private renters and b) owner-occupiers to make improvements to a dwelling’s thermal comfort? Please break this data down by year and provide separate data for renters and owner occupiers. 

Owner Occupiers
2016/17 - £124,061.67

2017/18 - £136,961.86

2018/19 - £144,559.98

2019/20 - £106,541.37

2020/21 - £226,950.55

Private Tenants

2020/21 - £9,000

Please note the funding provided to owner occupier and private tenants to improve the thermal comfort of their homes was all externally sourced and was not council funds.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
