Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Information Governance
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Please provide the following information for the most recent full financial year available:
1. The total number of Freedom of Information (FOI) requests handled.
Answer:
2024/25 - Figures from 1st April 2024 – 31st March 2025

1,209 - mix of FOI’s and EIRs.

2. The number of full-time equivalent (FTE) and part-time employees involved in handling FOI requests.
The Council’s Information Governance Team is made up of: 

2 Information Governance Officers - full time.
2 Information Governance Assistants - full time 

1 Information Risk Officer – full time 
1 Principal Lawyer/Data Protection Officer – 0.8 FTE
The above officers do all aspects of Information Governance, which includes dealing with FOI requests. 
Officers across the Council are also involved in gathering and providing information in relation to FOI requests. 

3. The names of any software systems or tools used by the FOI team to manage or track requests.
InCase Intelligence

4. The total annual cost of those software systems.
The system is used in other service areas across the Council. The contribution by the Information Governance Team is £2,212.00 per annum.
5. Any statistics or recorded information showing the average, median, and (if available) upper-quartile time spent per FOI request.
The Council does not record this information. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

6. The total salary cost of each employee (or, if easier, the total salary expenditure for all FOI-handling staff).
Pro-rata salary total of 5.81 FTE in the Information Governance unit is £221,249.
7. Copies of any internal communications, reports, or evaluations discussing the cost or effectiveness of FOI handling.
The Council’s internal audit, which is outsourced to Veritau, completed an internal audit of the Information Governance Team in 2024. This included the effectiveness of FOI handling. Please see attached the relevant pages of that audit. 
8. Confirmation of whether the system used for FOI handling is also used for Subject Access Requests, complaints, or any other casework.

InCase is also used for Subject Access Requests (SARs), Information Security Incidents, Information Sharing Agreements (ISAs) and Data Protection Impact Assessments, other requests for information outside of FOIA and EIR. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
