FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to make a request for information concerning allotments in your authority, under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 

Thank you in advance for your effort in meeting this request. If you believe you are not able to answer any of my questions for whatever reason, I kindly ask you to immediately contact Jack Alexander on 07834816325 to advise and assist pursuant to s.16. 

Please focus on Section A and B and then if possible Section C. However, if section C would require an extensive search in a number of locations or exceed the cost limit for FOI then please only complete Sections A and B.

Section A
1. How many allotment sites are there in your area and what are the total number of plots?
43 sites and 3185 plots
 

2. How many of those allotment sites do you have access to waiting list data for and what is the total number of plots on these sites? 
43 and 3185

3. What is the total number of people on waiting lists for the sites you have data for?
1069

4. Are any of these waiting lists closed to further applications? And if so, how long have they been closed and what was the total number of people on the list at the point of closure.
No sites are closed to further applications.
5. When applying for an allotment what information is required (ie. name, email, address etc) and how are applicants selected?
Applicants can apply for up to 4 sites through the city council’s website Apply for an allotment - Please note - Section 1 - Self (leicester.gov.uk) – applicants are then asked to contact the allotment societies directly or add their name to the waiting lists for council direct-let run sites. Applications are on a first-come first-served basis.

Section B
1. What is the total number of new tenancies signed for each full year (January to January) since 2012.
Data for allotment society-run sites is not held by Leicester City council.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Direct-Let council sites are as follows:

	2012
	9

	2013
	7

	2014
	8

	2015
	5

	2016
	1

	2017
	2

	2018
	7

	2019
	13

	2020
	7

	2021
	16

	2022
	6

	2023
	3


2. In addition, for each of the 10 individuals most recently awarded a plot (at the time of this FoI), please state the date at which there was first contact with the council (i.e. submitting an application) and the date at which they received their plot.
The system used by the Council for direct let sites transfers the tenant’s details from the waiting list and allocates them to a plot.  During this process, the original application date is not retained. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Section C
1. In the last ten full years (since 2012 - January to January) if possible, have any groups of residents made a representation in writing under Section 23(2) of the Small Holdings and Allotments Act 1908 concerning the duty of Councils to provide allotments?
None.

· If so, how many requests have you received? 

· and how many have been successful? 

 
Not applicable.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
