Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Council property maintenance 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. How many building/properties do you manage and maintain?
Answer:
Leicester City Council's Estates & Building Services manage and maintain 1,158 Sites (767 buildings) - excludes Housing Stock

2. How many of these buildings/properties have timber windows or timber structures?

This information in not captured on our CAFM System. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. How many of these buildings are listed?

28 Buildings are Listed
4. How many of these buildings are in a conservation area?

This information is not held by the Council. The information in not captured on our CAFM System
5. List of all buildings that are maintained and looked after by the council.

See attached 
6. Relevant department that works after the maintenance of these buildings

City Development & Transportation - Estates & Building Services

7. Best contact person for looking after the maintenance and upkeep of these buildings.
The Council can confirm that this information is held, however, disclosure of personal data relating to junior members of staff below Heads of Service are exempt from release as the Council considers that to be an absolute exemption under Section 40(2) (personal data), and this therefore constitutes a refusal under Section 17 of the Act. 

The Council judges that disclosure of this information to the wider world under the Act would constitute a breach of Data Protection principles, notably Principle 1-fair, lawful and transparent processing and Principle 2 – processing for specified, legitimate & explicit purposes. 

Please email any enquiries to EBSenquiries@leicester.gov.uk
8. Do you sub-contract any of your work for restorations work on Timber windows and if so, to whom.

Work is tendered when required.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
