FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information in an Excel format, if possible.

1) A list of private new-build developers who are or have been registered to build new property developments within your area, from January 2021 to the present day.
Builders are not required to register to build new developments with the Council.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2) The number of new-build dwellings that have been built in the local area from January 2021 to the present day.
628 from 1st January 2021 to 21st July 2022


3) In total how many building issues have been reported by the new-build residents since January 2021 until the present day within the local area and for which building companies are these associated?
Again, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4) What were the most common issues reported by new-build residents about their new properties from January 2021 to the present day?
This information is not held by Leicester City Council.

5) How many snagging complaints have been actioned in this local area since January 2021 to the present day and for which building companies are these associated?
This information is not held by Leicester City Council.

6) What were the most common snagging issues reported for new build developments from January 2021 to the present day?

This information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
