FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Q1) What is the name of your council?
Leicester City Council.

Q2) How many HMOs are occupied within your local council? Please break down in the following years 

        2019

        2020

        2021
Leicester City Council does not keep a register of all HMOs within its area.  We do hold a register of licenced HMOs which can be accessed at: Public Register of Licenced HMOs — Leicester Open Data.
A housing stock survey commissioned in 2019 using modelled data estimated there were 9,649 HMOs in the city.

Q3) How many complaints about other housemates have been made by those living in HMO's (this does not include complaints against family members or those in a relationship)? Please break down in the following years 

       2019

       2020

       2021
Q4) How many complaints from Q3 include violence, threats of violence intimidation or abuse of any kind?  Please break down in the following years?

       2019 

       2020

       2021

Q3 and 4) We do hold information about complaints against other housemates. However, unless this corresponded with harassment or threats of violence making the home unreasonable to occupy, we would not get involved in this type of issue, we would signpost to support agencies if appropriate. 
This information is not recorded in a reportable format and would require staff to trawl through all complaints/concerns raised for the three year period requested.
Section 12 of the FoI Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information

Q5) How many complaints about landlords have been made by those living in HMO's? Please break down in the following years

       2019

       2020

       2021

When service requests are received, they are not coded to differentiate who is complaining, we receive complaints/concerns from tenants, neighbours, Leicestershire Fire and Rescue, Police, other council services etc. 

Section 12 of the FoI Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information. 

Staff would need to trawl through all complaints/concerns for the three year period to establish if they were specific to a landlord of a HMO.
Therefore, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, to continue to comply with your request will exceed the appropriate limit.

Q6) How many requests to move out of a HMO have been made, in the following years?

       2019

       2020

       2021

Q7) Of those in Q6) how many were subsequently moved by the council into a) an alternative home b) an alternative HMO, c) no listed address and deemed homeless ? - Please break down into the following years?

       2019

       2020

       2021

Q6 and 7) The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
We don't ask on the housing application form if they occupy a HMO or not.  We would ask number of bedrooms and other information relevant to what we can assess as a housing need.

Please note if you are unable to provide calendar years, please do break down monthly for financial yearly recordings until December 2021

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
