Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Household Support Fund
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

Please display all data from September 30 to November 17.
1. How much has the council received through the Household Support Fund?
Answer:

£3,429,353.16 (this is entire allocation, to be spent through to March 2022)
2. How much of the money allocated to the council through the Household Support Fund has been distributed to claimants?
£221,520 of emergency food funding to those households that qualify for Free School Meals during the October 2021 half term holiday.

3. How many people who applied for support through the Household Support Fund were in receipt of Local Housing Allowance and Universal Credit?
No applications during this period, as our substantive scheme had not yet opened during the time period specified.
4. How many people who received support through the Household Support Fund were in receipt of Local Housing Allowance and Universal Credit?
Not recorded, therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held by the Council.

5. How many people who applied for support through the Household Support Fund were living under the no recourse to public funds condition? 
No applications during this period.

6. How many people who received support through the Household Support Fund were living under the no recourse to public funds condition? 
70 children identified as No Recourse to Public Funds.

7. What reasons did claimants give for request support through the Household Support Fund? Please break this information down into a table format.
Receiving benefits-related Free School Meals.

8. How does the council plan to spend the Household Support Fund?
Exemption Section 21 of the Act is being applied here, namely the information is already in the public domain. 

Please see our webpage here Household Support Fund (leicester.gov.uk) and policy here https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/a3wbzopl/household-support-fund-policy.pdf
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
