FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Since 1 January 2020, have any schools within your local authority implemented a system of “non-verbal days”, “quiet days”, “silent days” or similar initiatives where individual children are exempt from speaking for a period of time?

2. If possible, please provide:

a. The number of schools that have run such initiatives

b. The names of the schools and the date they introduced the initiative

3. If possible, please share any internal guidance, emails or policy documents related to these events

I am happy to receive responses in the form of documents, spreadsheets or email chains. If fulfilling the full request would exceed the cost limits, please prioritise Q1 and Q2. 

The Council does not hold this information; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.

Please contact individual schools directly. The link below will take you to a list of schools within the Authority:

http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council-services/education-lifelong-learning/about-schools/schools-directory/schools-directory/  School ward, head teacher, telephone, e mail etc. is available by clicking on the link for each school.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
