Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Pothole Repair & Damage Claims
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to request the following information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 in relation to potholes and associated vehicle damage within your local authority area. Please provide figures for the most recent full calendar year (or financial year, if easier):
1. The number of potholes reported (monthly breakdown if possible).
Answer:

All data for 2024
	Jan
	493

	Feb
	546

	Mar
	460

	Apr
	529

	May
	455

	Jun
	440

	Jul
	410

	Aug
	321

	Sept
	291

	Oct
	499

	Nov
	338

	Dec
	309

	Grand Total
	5091


2. The average number of calendar days between a pothole being reported and repaired.
23.3 days

3. The percentage of reported potholes repaired within: 
· 7 days
3.5%
· 14 days
24.8%
· 28 days
42.3%
4. The number of vehicle damage claims submitted as a result of potholes.
60
5. The number of pothole-related claims accepted and the total amount of compensation paid.
4 claims accepted

£717 total compensation paid

6. If recorded, the types of vehicles (make/model or vehicle category) involved in these damage claims.

We do not record the type (make/model or vehicle category). Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
