FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
For each calendar year 2022, 2023, 2024, and 2025 (to date):
•           Q1. The number of complaints received about an individual aesthetics practitioner or an aesthetics business.*

•           Q2. The number of inspections of an individual aesthetics practitioner or aesthetics business carried out following a complaint.

•           Q3. The number of individuals and/or businesses in this sector closed (either temporarily or permanently) or banned from carrying out specific cosmetic procedures by Environmental Health Officers.

	
	Q1. Number of complaints received
	Q2. Number of inspections carried out
	Q2. Number of businesses in this sector closed or banned

	2025 to date
	One
	One
	Zero banned 
We do not hold information regarding individuals/businesses that may have closed


Information prior to 2025 is not recorded by Leicester City Council due to an issue with the recording system used.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Our Trading Standards team have confirmed that in December 2023 they contacted businesses in Leicester to highlighting the provisions of the Botulinum Toxin and Cosmetic Fillers (Children) Act 2021 which made it illegal to carry out certain procedures on anyone under the age of 18 yrs.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
