FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Freedom of Information Request - Homeless Applications & Interim Accommodation

I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding the council’s expenditure on interim temporary accommodation and related costs, as well as the measures being taken to reduce such expenditures.

Please provide the following information:

1. Homeless Applications and Interim Accommodation:

- Over the past twelve months, how many people have made a homeless application to the Council? 

Dates 01/09/2023 - 31/08/24, number of applications raised: 3199

- Over the past twelve months, how many people have been provided with interim accommodation pursuant to Section 188(1) of the Housing Act 1996?

All households (unique household numbers) which entered Temporary accommodation between dates 01/09/2023 - 31/08/24: 1100
- Over the past twelve months, how many people have been provided with interim accommodation pursuant to Section 189(b) of the Housing Act 1996? 

Relief duty under 189(b) covers lots of different variables but specifically relating to interim accommodation provided under relief duty, Leicester has provided 1072 between dates 01/09/2023 - 31/08/24

- Over the past twelve months, what was the total cost of providing interim accommodation? 

Total: £15,578,853.99

The costs are exclusive of VAT. Gross costs excludes any income from Housing benefits, Rents etc.

a) What proportion of this cost was paid to Travelodge and/or any of its parent companies/subsidiaries? 

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

Leicester City Council uses Click Travel to source temporary accommodation for Homelessness Services, Families, and Council Tenants.  The Council is then invoiced on a weekly basis for all accommodation supplied for that week.  These invoices are then processed by the individual service areas and a total payment is taken from their respective budget.  However, this information is not recorded by provider, we do not hold a breakdown of the spend with each.

Staff would be required to trawl through every invoice and extract the payments for each provider. We would also need to factor in any adjustments, such as credit notes etc. There are 352 invoices for 2023/24.  Allowing 10-15 minutes to locate and trawl through each invoice would result in over 60 hours of officer time.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

b) What was the total amount paid to Travelodge and/or its related entities over the past twelve months? 

Please see the above response.
2. Temporary Accommodation Expenditure and Associated Costs:

- What has been the total expenditure on interim temporary accommodation (e.g., Travelodge, B&Bs) for homeless individuals over the past three financial years?

Total over 3 years: £25,439,291.70

The costs are exclusive of VAT. Gross costs excludes any income from Housing benefits, Rents etc.

- Please provide a breakdown of these costs by location, including the number of placements made outside the borough. 
- What has been the total expenditure on affiliated costs such as storage, taxis, and other related services for individuals placed in temporary accommodation outside the borough over the past three financial years?  
- Please provide details of these costs by category (e.g., storage, transportation, etc.) and location. 
In response to the above 3 questions.  This information isn’t recorded in a reportable format.  Staff would be required to trawl through all invoices/case files etc. to gather and collate the specific costs requested.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

3. Protection of Personal Property for Homeless Applicants:

- Over the past twelve months, how many homeless applicants have had their personal property protected by the local authority? 
None.
- What is the average length of time that a homeless applicant’s personal property is stored by the local authority? 
Not applicable.

- What is the average cost of storing a homeless applicant’s personal property while they are in interim accommodation? N/A

- Under what circumstances does the local authority protect the personal property of homeless applicants? 

Summary

Many people who are homeless make their own satisfactory arrangements around the storage of their personal possessions whilst homeless.

Housing Advisors must be aware of the Council’s duty under s211 Housing Act 1996 (as amended) which is ‘in summary’:

To take reasonable steps to prevent the loss of, or to prevent or mitigate damage to, any personal property of the applicant where the Council owes the applicant any of the accommodation duties (s188 (interim), s190 (intentional), s193 (main duty) or s200 (people being referred)

It also applies to anyone owed a ‘relief duty’ under s189B or a ‘prevention duty’ under s195

The Council can also exercise it’s power outside of the above circumstances 

The prerequisites

(a) there is a danger of loss of, or damage to, the applicant’s personal property;

(b) because the applicant is unable to protect it or deal with it; and,

(c) no other suitable arrangements have been, or are being, made,

We haven’t directly provided storage however we have signposted clients to storage providers who offer very reasonable rates and the clients who have been signposted have been happy to pay for the storage themselves.

- As part of the homeless application process, does the local authority expressly ask the homeless applicant whether they need their personal property protected? 
No

- If not, please state the reasons why this question is not asked. 
We ask whether their property would be at risk and only then discuss the storage option.

- Please provide copies of the local authority’s policies regarding homeless applications. 

The homeless application process is a legal process, therefore, we follow the legislative framework along with the Homeless Code of Guidance of good practice.  

- Please provide a copy of the local authority’s policy regarding the protection of the personal property of homeless applicants. 
Policy is being produced, however at present, we do not hold a finalised document. This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
- Please disclose a copy of the council's homeless procedures manual or policy document followed by housing solutions officers at its homeless service centres/homeless persons offices. 

The homeless application process is a legal process, therefore, we follow the legislative framework along with the Homeless Code of Guidance of good practice.  

- Over the past three years, how many complaints have been made by homeless applicants regarding the council’s failure to protect their personal property? 
Again, this information isn’t recorded in a reportable format.  Staff would be required to trawl through all complaints/case files etc. to gather and collate the specific figures requested.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

4. Proactive Measures to Reduce Temporary Accommodation Costs:

- What specific measures has the council taken to reduce the reliance on temporary accommodation outside the borough, such as Travelodge and B&Bs?

The Council look at individual need and in the main provide accommodation in the jurisdiction of Leicester City, however, due to pressures we are currently developing an “out of area policy” which will be published in due course which will stipulate clearly this is used as a last resort. The current usage is minimal, and the priority remains to use temporary accommodation within Leicester City boundaries or within Leicestershire.  

- Has the council developed or initiated any programs to increase the availability of local temporary accommodation, particularly through the use of empty properties or land within the borough? If so, please provide details. 

We haven’t developed or initiated any programmes, buildings and sites are assessed on an individual basis as and when they are referred to us, we carry out an Asset Development Review, which looks at options for the site/building and the financial feasibility etc.  a decision is then made on how the site/land is taken forward, this may mean it’s developed in house or potentially sold on the open market for others to develop.  This is an ongoing business as usual process and not specific to the delivery of temporary accommodation but the delivery of a range of affordable housing products.

We have a programme to deliver 225 self-contained units that will be used to temporary accommodation and a further 125 lease properties to support the customers to move on from temporary accommodation. The properties will be a combination of blocks, and a range of bed sizes. The purchase of these units would enable those in TA to move from Bed & Breakfast accommodation and remain in a much more suitable temporary home while they continue to receive priority to bid for suitable accommodation to secure a permanent home. The programme to deliver these has recently started. 
The Council has and will spend over £350m on the delivery of new affordable housing in the City over the last 5 years and coming 3 years. This has delivered over 1,100 new affordable homes and will deliver a further 1,500 new affordable homes for the City,
5. Utilisation of Empty Properties and Land: 

- How many empty properties and parcels of land are currently owned by the council that could potentially be used for temporary accommodation? 
Nil
- Has the council considered or initiated any compulsory purchase orders (CPOs) to acquire vacant properties for conversion into temporary accommodation? If so, please provide details, including the number of properties targeted, the outcome, and associated costs. 
No, although the Council do have a specialist Private Sector Empty Homes team whom have been responsible for the delivery of 180 Empty homes each year back in to use. PRS Lanldors in this situation are offered the option to lease their Empty property to the Council for 5 years and these properties are utilised for those facing Homelessness.
- What steps has the council taken to encourage community/ non-profit groups or social enterprises to make use of disused land or buildings via adverse possession for temporary accommodation or support services? Please provide examples, if any. 
The Council are a key partner in the Homelessness Charter, this group communicate over the important need for private property development to incorporate Affordable housing, they also work with business over the potential delivery of temporary accommodation (through other partners) in Leicester. 
6. Comparative Models and Best Practices:

- Is the council aware of successful models such as Calderwood House in Cumbria, where an empty property (a former police station) was transformed into temporary accommodation and support services? If so, has the council explored similar initiatives within the borough? Please provide details of any discussions, plans, or actions taken.

No, we are not aware of Calderwood House in Cumbria however, we meet regularly with Advisors from MHCLG to look at and share good practice across local authorities nationally.  

- Has the council considered offering similar arrangements, such as a peppercorn rent, to community groups or social enterprises willing to repurpose empty properties for temporary accommodation or support services? If not, what are the reasons for not pursuing this option?

We have/do offer grants to organisations to buy properties and use them as temporary accommodation.  We have just completed one with One Roof Leicester where we have part funded the acquisition of a property using our retained right to buy receipts.

Neighbourhood Services has worked with Estates and Building services to lease community buildings which are surplus to requirements to community organisations at less than best consideration under the Council’s Community Asset Transfer policy, to provide community benefits to local residents.  To date 11 facilities have been leased under this process. 

We have enabled tenant’s associations to have buildings and residents’ groups.  

7. Support Services for Individuals in Temporary Accommodation: 

What support services does the council currently provide for individuals placed in temporary accommodation outside the borough, particularly in terms of maintaining their connection to local support networks, healthcare providers, and other essential services?
Most individuals and families as already stated are placed within Leicester. When there are families placed out of area for longer periods, we will, if required pay for transport to attend critical medical meetings, a recent introduction too is to look at providing transport for children to remain at their school within the city.  However, most out of areas placements are due to emergency placements where this is the only available suitable T.A. and we then usually bring them back into the city within 24/48 hours.

Are there any programs in place to assist individuals in transitioning from temporary accommodation outside the borough to permanent housing within the borough? If so, please provide details on the nature of the support provided, outcomes, and costs. 
As described this is not appliable for Leicester
8. Monitoring, Evaluation, and Complaints: 

How does the council monitor and evaluate the effectiveness of its temporary accommodation placements, particularly those made outside the borough? Please provide any available data on the impact of these placements on residents, including any assessments of detriment or distress caused.

A detailed specification is in place for all procured temporary accommodation. Alongside this an officer is responsible for the monitoring of these contracts.
As already explained, very little out of City TA is used and then only for very short periods of time.
Has the council conducted any cost-benefit analysis comparing the current expenditure on temporary accommodation outside the borough with potential savings from investing in local solutions (e.g., repurposing empty properties)? If so, please provide the findings. 
Not applicable.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
