FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. The methods of disposal for rejected household recycling used by your authority for the following years:

·        2017/18
·        2018/19
·        2019/20
·        2020/21

Some wastes are rejected as household recycling prior to their collection as recycling at the kerbside. Where visual inspection indicates that the presented waste is unsuitable for recycling, it is collected as general waste and treated in the same manner as other domestic general waste collected by Biffa Leicester Limited (BLL). The domestic general waste from Leicester is treated by mechanical and biological treatment. 

Kerbside collected recycling is bulked up by BLL, and sent to specialised material recycling facilities (MRFs) for sorting. Any loads rejected at the MRF, the will be disposed of by the MRF by sending it to an energy recovery facility.

2. The annual cost to dispose of rejected household recycling within your authority for the following years:

·        2017/18
·        2018/19
·        2019/20
·        2020/21

We do not hold that information. Leicester City Council has an integrated waste collection and 
disposal contract with Biffa Leicester Limited, and the cost of disposal of waste is included within the overall unitary charge for the contract.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. The main reasons for household recycling being rejected. For example, items were contaminated or not suitable for recycling.

The main reason for rejection is that the waste is contaminated with unrecyclable items such as textiles, nappies or food waste.

4. Any guidance or instructions under which recycling centres determine the acceptance or rejection of items collected within your authority. 

	Non-Recyclable or Prohibitive Materials.

This list is not exhaustive, but provides a reasonably comprehensive list of material which are non-compliant with Target or Non-Target specified materials.
	For clarity, a material specification sheet should be used to identify Non-Recyclables including a subset of prohibitive material. Prohibitive material could cause serious injury to personnel or cause damage to the plant. 

 

Non-Recyclable Items
Fines

Card with bubble pack/padding attached/ foil backed card

Ceramics/ornaments & crockery/Pyrex

Christmas lights, Christmas wrapping paper

Target Recyclables contaminated or containing food waste

Kitchen or food waste

domestic refuse bag, typically black

Electrical waste(WEEE) including hoses off hoovers etc.

Green/garden waste/Soil, garden flower pots

Textiles, clothing or shoes

Paint tins full or empty

Plastic trims, frames, mouldings, plastic toys

Plate glass & car (windows), Mirrors

Polystyrene packaging or beads, Corks

Shrink wrap/bubble wrap/Crisp packets

Utensils or tools, knives & other sharp objects

Video/tape cassettes, CD’s, DVD's on their cases

Prohibitive Items
Burnt or fire damaged material
Clinical waste, needless /syringes/Blister packs
Cushions /mattresses/ Duvet/Carpets
Dead animals
Full or part filled builder’s sacks
Gas bottles, Hazardous waste, Clinical waste ,Medical waste
Large Batteries, i.e. Lorry/Car & NiCad
Large pieces of sheet metal 500mm x 500mm
Machine or engine parts
Nappies & feminine hygiene products
Plastic cables/ties/strapping/banding/ropes/belts
Rubble/Concrete/kerb stones/slabs, house bricks/fence post
Wood & MDF




You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
