FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I would like to request the following information:
Please find the relevant information attached. There are some exemptions, therefore, please see the responses under the questions below.

1) How many Trading Standards Officers in your Local Authority (by FTE) in each of the following years: 2007,2008,2009,2010,2011,2012,2013,2018,2019,2020,2021?
We do not hold the data for the years 2007 to 2011.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2) How many Trading Standards Officers hold qualifications in Animal Health and Welfare for these years?

3) Number of full-time equivalent animal health qualified staff working on Animal Health And Welfare Enforcement in your Local Authority for these years?

4) How many premises with an animal health & welfare inspection risk were there in your Local Authority for these years? (How many of these were farms?)
We do not hold this data for the years requested.  In total there are 135 open premises currently on the Trading Standards business register categorised as either ‘animal boarding and care establishment’, ‘animal breeders’ or ‘farm’.  


5) How many complaints or referrals relating to animal health and welfare were received for these years?
The response attached includes the following complaint types; ‘Farm Animal Health Welfare’, ‘Domestic Animal Health’, ‘Farm animals’, ‘Domestic animals’ or ‘Other animal issues’:


6) How many farm inspections/visits did your Local Authority carry out in each of these years? (If possible, please split between Random, risk-based, compliance-based and targeted inspections (or other please specify) )

7) How many of these inspections were found to be non-compliant and required some remedial action in each of these years?

8) How many of the following enforcement actions were taken in each of these years: advice, warnings, prosecution (or other please specify)?

If it does not exceed the time limit, please also provide the following:
9) Trading Standards Service budget for these years and if available the budget for animal health and welfare in these years

There is not a specific budget figure for just ‘Animal Welfare’. The figure provided is the total Trading Standards Budget for that year. Specific budget figures from 2007 to 2013 are no longer held.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
