Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: community hubs
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. The number of Islamic 'community hubs' there are in Leicester which conduct Friday prayers

2.
The number of planning complaints received about these by the planning department

3. The number that have been closed down due to them not having the correct planning.

Answer:

If respect of Qs.1-3, this information is not held. Use of property as Islamic community hub and prayers are not classified separately from generic description as ‘place of worship and community facilities’ in the planning system hence the information requested is not available.
This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA and Regulation 14 of the EIR, because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of FOIA and Regulation 12(4)(a) of EIR, the information is not held by Leicester City Council.


4.
If the council is actively trying to get these hubs to apply for planning permission.
As part of planning enforcement investigations, responsible individuals and organisations relating to planning cases reported as breaches are informed that they need planning permission if this has not been obtained.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
