Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Youth Justice Service
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
For each of the following financial years (separately): 2021/22, 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25

1) Number of under-18s referred to the Youth Justice Service after a caution or sentence for the following types of offending, broken down by year of age at referral and gender:

a) Violence against the person
Answer: 

see below

b) Sexual offences
16 sexual offences in the period of April 21 – March 25 and age range 12 – 17 and all males.
	Sexual offences Youth Justice Service after a caution or a sentence
	Numbers

	2021/22
	Less than 5

	2022/23
	Less than 5

	2023/24
	5

	2024/25
	8


c) Offending or behaviour classed as violence against women and girls (if you need this to be defined, please use NPCC definition)
d) Offending or behaviour linked to misogyny
In respect of Qs. c & d, we don’t capture this data.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

e) Total (i.e. people referred for more than one of these reasons would be counted only once)
376
2) Number of under-18s referred to the Youth Justice Service for preventative or diversionary support (i.e. not after caution or sentence) after being linked to the following types of offending or behaviour, broken down by year of age at referral and gender:

a) Violence against the person
see below

b) Sexual offences
13 sexual offences in the period of April 2021 – March 2025 and age range 11 – 17 years of those – 10 males and 3 females
	Sexual offences Youth Justice Service after a caution or a sentence
	Numbers

	2021/22
	Less than 5

	2022/23
	Less than 5

	2023/24
	Less than 5

	2024/25
	5


c) Offending or behaviour classed as violence against women and girls (if you need this to be defined, please use NPCC definition)
d) Offending or behaviour linked to misogyny
With regard to Qs. c & d, this information is not held.  We don’t capture this data.


e) Total (i.e. people referred for more than one of these reasons would be counted only once)

464
	Violence against the person Youth Justice Service after a caution or sentence
	
	
	Males
	Females

	
	10-14
	15
	16
	17
	
	2021/22
	66
	22

	2021/22
	16
	22
	31
	19
	
	2022/23
	82
	13

	2022/23
	22
	24
	29
	20
	
	2023/24
	72
	12

	2023/24
	14
	14
	25
	31
	
	2024/25
	76
	18

	2024/25
	17
	5
	32
	40
	
	
	
	


	Violence against the person Youth Justice Service for preventative or diversionary support
	
	
	Males
	Females

	
	10-14
	15
	16
	17
	
	2021/22
	88
	56

	2021/22
	63
	35
	25
	21
	
	2022/23
	85
	54

	2022/23
	60
	33
	26
	20
	
	2023/24
	57
	40

	2023/24
	43
	20
	17
	17
	
	2024/25
	55
	30

	2024/25
	33
	17
	19
	16
	
	
	
	


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
