Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004
Re: in-house ecological expertise
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.
You asked:

I am writing to make a request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations about the access your local authority has to ecological expertise in-house. 


“In-house ecological expertise” is defined as those who are employed by the council on a part-time or full-time basis and who have Chartered Ecological status (CEcol).

In March 2018, it was revealed that only 1 in 4 councils had access to some form of ecological expertise within their own teams. Would you please tell me how many chartered ecologists the council has employed over the last three years between May 2018 to May 2021?

Would you please provide this figure in terms of FTE equivalence. I would prefer to receive this information electronically, preferably as a data set in Excel and not as a PDF, to include the following information as set out below. If the information is not possible to put into a spreadsheet, please provide the information in its existing format, rather than rejecting this FOI request. 

For example, if you have employed only one chartered ecologist 2.5days a week over the past three years the FTE figure = 0.5

	2018-2019 chartered
	2019-2020 chartered
	2020-2021 chartered

	0.5
	0.5
	0.5


Answer:
	2018/19 
chartered
	2019/20 
chartered
	2020/21 
chartered

	2.0
	2.0
	1.5


As a second part to this request would you please also tell me how many “other environmental experts” the council employs, who are either unchartered but hold a position as an environmentalist or hold chartered status in a related discipline e.g. someone who holds Chartered Environmentalist (CEnv) status. Would you please also provide this figure in terms of FTE equivalence. E.g. If you employed one chartered environmentalist and one unchartered environmental expert full-time between May 2018 – May 2020 but then lost one of these between May 2020- May 2021 then the FTE figure would be as follows:

	2018-2019 other expertise
	2019-2020 other expertise
	2020-2021 other expertise

	2
	2
	1

	
	


	
	2018/19 

other expertise
	2019/20 

other expertise
	2020/21 

other expertise

	Energy and Sustainability Service
	5
	6
	9

	Air Quality
	1
	1
	1

	Pollution Control
	8.6
	8.6
	8.6

	Waste Management
	11.5
	11.5
	11.5


“Other environmental experts” have been included from the following primary environmental service areas: Energy and Sustainability, Air Quality, Pollution Control and Waste management.  However, this does not provide the whole range of environmental expertise we have within the organisation. 
In addition many of our services have a significant environmental element within them.  We have many chartered professionals working in Leicester City Council who are members of chartered institutions who have a key environmental function, including environmental health officers, planners, transport engineers, surveyors, horticulturalists, arboriculturists etc.  
We have not included all these functions as we do not hold the data to provide them, therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
