FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Request 1:

For each of the last five calendar years (1st January 2019 - 31st December 2024):
1. How many complaints did your council receive about Christmas decorations/lights on/in domestic properties (for example, too big/loud/flashy)?

2. How many complaints did your council receive about Christmas decorations/lights on/in commercial properties?

3. For Q1 and Q2, what were the most common complaints?

4. In relatoin to Q1 and 2, which post codes/streets received the most complaints?

5. How many enforcement notices were issued as a result of complaints received in Q1 and Q2.

Request 2:

For each calendar year (between 1st January 2020 and 31st December 2024) plaese advise of:
1. The number of council housing tenants who have complained or requested to be re-housed due to reasons involving paranormal activity, ghost sightings, monsters, hauntings, aliens, demons or other supernatural disturbances in their property (please break this down by each category),

2. If held, any summaries or descriptions (suitably anonymised) of the nature of those complaints or reasons given.

3. Any internal correspondence or policy guidance on how such cases are handled (e.g., whether such claims are formally assessed, dismissed, or acted upon).

If it is not possible to supply all of the information due to cost limits, I would be happy to refine the request, for example, by limiting to the last 3 years, or omitting point 3.

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information requested in a reportable format; this data isn’t collated.  We do not record the nature of a complaint in a format that can be searched for specific categories.  The Corporate Complaints team would need to trawl through all complaints received to establish if they related to the specifics of your request.  For the time period referenced, this would require hundreds of hours of officer time.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
