
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I should be grateful if you can furnish me with detailed information with regard to the Mayor (Sir Peter Soulsby) and his direct (and/or indirect) role in promoting diversity in Leicester. To this end can you submit the following - since taking office:

a. How many meetings has Sir Peter Soulsby had with regard to diversity?
b. How many meetings has Sir Peter Soulsby had with each faith community (namely, Christians, Muslims, Hindus, Jain, Sikhs & Buddhist)?

In respect of questions a and b, Section 12 of the Act allows a public authority to refuse a request for information where the cost of dealing with it would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450 (equivalent to 18 hours of work). Staff would need to trawl through 11 years of diary entries and meeting notes to determine where diversity may have been discussed or meetings held with faith communities. 
Diversity is a wide ranging issue which is regularly referred to and discussed in meetings, not least due to the diversity of the city, and just checking diary entries would not always indicate the full range of discussions that took place at any given meeting, nor are all meetings formally recorded. This is therefore a refusal notice under the provisions of Section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit as it would involve checking the 11 years of data and would exceed 18 hours (based on 1 hour for every month from May 2011 to October 2022 = 137hours).

c. In light of the recent disturbances in Leicester b/w Muslims and Hindus, who has Sir Peter Soulsby met (in person or via internet)? When? Purpose of those meetings (and meeting notes)? And any outcomes?

20th September              

All Member Briefing, supported by Alison Greenhill - Chief Operating Officer, Richard Sword – Strategic Director, Sean Atterbury – Director, Sue Welford – Principal Education Officer, Caroline Tote – Director, Martin Samuels – Strategic Director. 

21st September               

Discussion between the City Mayor and Executive Team regarding Leicester East.

21st September               

Media - Financial Times, City Mayor.

21st September               

Multi-Faith Community Briefing, attended by various community representatives, and supported by Alison Greenhill - Chief Operating Officer, Richard Sword – Strategic Director, Sean Atterbury – Director, Sue Welford – Principal Education Officer, Caroline Tote – Director, Martin Samuels – Strategic Director, Andrew Shilliam, Head of the City Mayor’s Office. 

22nd September      

Community Tensions Catch Up, attended by the City Mayor and Executive Team, Alison Greenhill – Chief Operating Officer, Richard Sword – Strategic Director, Sean Atterbury – Director, Andrew Shilliam – Head of the City Mayor’s Office, Miranda Cannon – Director, Caroline Tote – Director, Sue Welford – Principal Education Officer. 

22nd September       

Media - Radio Leicester, City Mayor. 

30th September       

Leicester East Briefing, Ward Cllrs invited from Stoneygate, Belgrave, Spinney Hills, North Evington, Wycliffe wards, together with the City Mayor and Executive Team, supported by Alison Greenhill – Chief Operating Officer, Richard Sword – Strategic Director, Sean Atterbury – Director, Caroline Tote – Director, Sue Welford – Principal Education Officer, Martin Samuels – Strategic Director, Sophie Maltby – Principal Education Officer.

30th September       

Leicester East Briefing, City Mayor and all Councillors invited, supported by Alison Greenhill – Chief Operating Officer, Richard Sword – Strategic Director, Sean Atterbury – Director, Caroline Tote – Director, Sue Welford – Principal Education Officer, Martin Samuels – Strategic Director, Sophie Maltby – Principal Education Officer.

4th October             

Meeting with Imams at FMO, attended by City Mayor               

5th October             

Meeting with the Leicester Daman Community, attended by the City Mayor, Cllr Clair, Deputy City Mayor, and Cllr Luis Fonseca

10th October 

Youth Community Meeting, chaired and arranged by Cllr Kirk Master, attended but not arranged by the City Mayor. 

14th October
Meeting with the Hindu & Jain Faith Leaders re Leicester East tensions. Attended but not arranged by the City Mayor.
These meetings were not recorded or minuted therefore, there are no notes or actions/outcomes held by Leicester City Council.  This letter acts as a

refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000

because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held

by Leicester City Council.

d. In light of the recent disturbances in Leicester b/w Muslims and Hindus, who has Sir Peter Soulsby emailed and/or telephoned to discuss issues directly related? Copies of emails required where applicable.

The City Mayor has received and replied to numerous e mails and calls from concerned constituents regarding the disturbances in the City.   However, where information is requested for disclosure to the wider world (which is how any disclosure made under the FOI Act must be considered) a consideration must be made as to whether this would breach Data Protection Principles.

This information can only be released if to do so would not contravene any of the principles set out in Article 5(1) of the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR).

Here, the Council judges that the emails and correspondence it holds, containing names, addresses, opinions, concerns etc.  have been shared with the City Mayor out of concern for the situation.   Disclosure to the wider world would constitute a breach of Data Protection principles, notably Principle 1-fair, lawful and transparent processing and Principle 2 – processing for specified and not incompatible purposes. Therefore, this Information is exempt from release under Section 40(2) of The FOI Act as this information constitutes personal data.

Section 41(1) of The FOIA is also judged to be applicable, relating to Information Provided in Confidence.

To explain further, Section 41 provides that information is exempt if it was:

(a) obtained by the public authority from any other person (including another public authority), and

(b) the disclosure of the information to the public (otherwise than under this Act) by the public authority holding it would constitute a breach of confidence actionable by that or any other person.”

Individuals who have submitted their concerns to the Council have done so with the clear understanding that their details will not be disclosed to the wider world (which is how any such disclosure must be judged).

e. Does Sir Peter Soulsby have any direct/indirect links with any community organisations/personnel who are linked in any way to the said disturbances?

Due to the nature of the role, the City Mayor works with and has links with all communities in Leicester and with community organisations who represent those communities. It is unclear what is meant here in terms of references to ‘organisations/personnel who are linked in any way to the said disturbances’ and therefore we cannot provide anything further. If you’d like to clarify what is meant by this question, we’d be happy to consider a response. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk

