Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: holiday childcare
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Section A – Cost of holiday childcare

2. Please give the typical (average/mean) price per day and per week of a full-time place in a holiday club or childminder providing holiday care in your local area. 
	
	Typical price per day
	Typical price per week

	Maintained sector holiday club
	
	

	PVI sector holiday club
	£57.50
	£270

	Childminder providing holiday care
	£47.50
	£237.50


Section B – Amount of holiday childcare in your area

3. What is the total number of holiday clubs in the PVI and maintained sector, and the total number of childminders providing holiday care?

	Total holiday clubs in maintained sector
	1

	Total holiday clubs in PVI sector
	11

	Total childminders providing holiday care
	13


Section C – When holiday childcare is available

4. In your area, how many holiday clubs and childminders who offer care during the school holidays are open for a full day (8am to 6pm, Monday to Friday)?
	
	Number of holiday childcare providers open for a full day (8am to 6pm, Monday to Friday)

	Maintained sector holiday clubs
	0

	PVI sector holiday clubs
	5

	Childminders providing holiday care
	8


5. In your area, how many maintained holiday clubs are usually open in each of the school holidays and inset days? 
	
	Summer holiday
	Easter holiday
	Christmas holiday
	Half terms
	INSET days

	Example
	10
	6
	3
	6
	2

	Maintained sector holiday clubs
	1
	1
	1
	0
	0


	
	Summer holiday
	Easter holiday
	Christmas holiday
	Half terms
	INSET days

	PVI sector holiday clubs
	11
	11
	5
	10
	3


7. In your area, how many childminders who provide care during school holidays are usually open in each of the school holidays and inset days? 
	
	Summer holiday
	Easter holiday
	Christmas holiday
	Half terms
	INSET days

	Childminders providing holiday childcare
	13
	13
	2
	13
	10


Section D - Changes to childcare providers and places

8. For the following categories, please mark the box (X) indicating whether the total number of holiday childcare providers (clubs and childminders) has increased, decreased, or stayed the same since 2024.
	
	Increased
	Decreased
	Same as 2024
	Not applicable (none either year)
	Data not held or cannot tell

	Maintained sector holiday clubs
	
	
	
	
	x

	PVI sector holiday clubs
	
	
	
	
	x

	Childminders providing holiday care
	
	
	
	
	x


9. Similarly, please mark the box (X) indicating whether the total number of holiday childcare places across all provider types has increased, decreased, or stayed the same since 2024.
	
	Increased
	Decreased
	Same as 2024
	Data not held or cannot tell

	Overall number of places 
	x
	
	
	


Section E – Whether there is enough holiday childcare

10. Please tell us the percentage of children in the following groups for whom you have enough holiday childcare. If you do not know the exact percentage, please answer to the best of your knowledge.
	
	100%
	75% to 99%
	50% to 74%
	25% to 49%
	For 24% or less
	Data not held or cannot tell

	Four- to seven-year-olds
	
	
	
	
	
	x

	8- to 11-year-olds
	
	
	
	
	
	x

	12- to 14-year-olds
	
	
	
	
	
	x

	Children and young people with SEND
	
	
	
	
	
	x

	Parents working full time (9am to 5pm on weekdays)
	
	
	
	
	
	x

	Parents working atypical hours (outside 9am to 5pm on weekdays)
	
	
	
	
	
	x

	Families living in rural areas (please leave this question blank if there are no rural areas in your local authority)
	
	
	
	
	
	


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
