FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I am requesting data on Penalty Charge Notices (PCNs) issued for parking contraventions by your authority.

This request relates only to PCNs issued for parking offences in both on-street locations and council-operated off-street car parks. 

If your authority does not operate Civil Parking Enforcement, please confirm accordingly.

Please provide the following information for each of the last three full calendar years (2022, 2023 and 2024):

1) Annual totals (1 January – 31 December):
a) The total number of parking PCNs issued, broken down by on-street and off-street.
2022 On Street PCN’s issued - 77218
2022 Off Street PCN’s issued – 1692

2023 On Street PCN’s issued – 100,331
2023 Off Street PCN’s issued - 2204

2024 On Street PCN’s issued – 118,483
2024 Off Street PCN’s issued - 2733


b) The total revenue generated from parking PCNs, broken down by on-street and off-street.
We do not hold a breakdown of the total revenue generated by on and off street parking.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
The full revenue for years 2022 – 2024 can be found via the following link: 

Parking - PCNs issued and income by year: 2007 - 2024 — Leicester Open Data

c) The top five streets or council-operated car park locations with the highest number of parking PCNs issued during the year, including:
- The street or location name
- The number of PCNs issued at that location during the year

2022

London Road – 3,903

Western Road – 1,789

Saxby Street – 1,438

Wellington Street – 1,210

Lee Street – 1,096

2023

London Road – 3,496

Western Road – 2,055

Granby Street – 1,459

Saxby Street – 1,132

Wellington Street – 1,083

2024

London Road – 5,515

Western Road – 2,848

Bowling Green Street – 1,861

Wellington Street – 1,735

Saxby Street – 1,610

2) December totals (1 December – 31 December):
a) The total number of parking PCNs issued in December, broken down by on-street and off-street.
Dec 2022 On Street PCN’s issued – 7091
Dec 2022 Off Street PCN’s issued – 100

Dec 2023 On Street PCN’s issued – 9267
Dec 2023 Off Street PCN’s issued – 136

Dec 2024 On Street PCN’s issued – 8969
Dec 2024 Off Street PCN’s issued – 262

b) The total revenue generated from these PCNs in December, broken down by on-street and off-street.
As above, this information isn’t held.  The full revenue for years 2022 – 2024 can be found via the following link: 

Parking - PCNs issued and income by year: 2007 - 2024 — Leicester Open Data

c) The top five streets or council-operated car park locations with the highest number of parking PCNs issued during December, including:
- The street or location name
- The number of PCNs issued at that location during December

2022

London Road – 457

Granby Street - 143

Western Road – 141

Lee Street – 114

Infirmary Square – 109

2023

London Road – 505

Western Road – 225

Bowling Green Street – 173

Saxby Street 158

Granby Street - 132

2024

London Road – 526

Western Road – 163

Wellington Street – 146

Bowling Green Street – 143

Bishop Street - 121

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
