FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am submitting a Freedom of Information request regarding abandoned vehicles within your local authority area since 2022.

Please could you provide the following information by completing the tables below:

1. Abandoned Vehicles
	Calendar Year
	Number of abandoned vehicles reported to your local authority
	Number of these vehicles retrieved by the owner
	Number of vehicles deemed as abandoned

(I.e. it’s only fit to be destroyed/has no number plates/owner cannot be found or fails to comply with a notice to collect the vehicle)

	2022
	1494
	Unknown*
	107

	2023
	1681
	Unknown*
	113

	2024
	2141
	Unknown*
	125


*The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2. Outcomes for Abandoned Vehicles
	Calendar Year
	Number of abandoned vehicles disposed of / scrapped by the council
	Number of abandoned vehicles sold/auctioned by the council

	2022
	107
	0

	2023
	113
	0

	2024
	125
	0


            

3. Including all abandoned vehicles that were sold / auctioned in 2024, what was the highest sale / auction price achieved for an abandoned vehicle? please be as accurate with the sale price as possible. 
£0.00

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
